Bid Summary

Associated Students Bike Shop Replacement

FM0902625/987719

BASE BID

COMPENSABLE DELAY

TOTAL PROJECT COST

General Contractor

Base Bid

Compensable
Delay

Total Base Bid w/Compensable

Days|Compensable |Delays

Atlas Performance Ind.

No Bid Submitted

10

1916 Stowell Rd

Santa Maria, CA 93458

T: 805/928-8689 FAX: 805/928-9190

Subconractors

Blum & Sons Electric

No Bid Submitted

10

606 Linden Ave

Carpinteria, CA 93013

T: 805/684-1010 FAX: B05/684-2260

Subconractors

Bottenfield Construction

No Bid Submitted

10

24832 Apple Street

Newhall, CA 91321

T: 661/260-1720 FAX: 661/260-1401

Subconractors

California Coastal Dev.

No Bid Submitted

10

P.0. Box 7709

Santa Maria, CA 93456

T: 805/346-2050 FAX: 805/346-6235

Subconractors

Carroll Construction Co.

No Bid Submitted

10

P.0. Box 50131

‘{Santa Barbara, CA 93150

T: 805/966-4810 FAX: 805/966-5654

Subconractors

Electrical Solutions Comp

No Bid Submitted

10

2368 Eastman Ave

Ventura, CA 93003

T:805/658-0848 FAX: 805/658-0868

Subcontractors

F lli Carpentry

No Bid Submitted

10

14 18th St.

Cayucos, CA 93430

T: B05/440-5653 FAX: 805/995-3383

Subcontractors

University Repreéentative: Croft Yjader
Bid Opening Date: April 24, 2009 @ 2:30PM



Bid Summary

Associated Students Bike Shop Replacement
FM0902625/987719

BASE BID

COMPENSABLE DELAY

TOTAL PROJECT COST

General Contractor

Base Bid

Compensable
Delay

Days

Total
Compensable

Base Bid w/Compensable
Delays

Ferrari Development Inc.

No Bid Submitted

10

1350 Primivera Lane

Nipomo, CA 93444

T: B805/440-5133 FAX: 805/928-3814

Subcontractors

Gutierrez Construction

No Bid Submitted

10

207 W. L.A. Ave.

Moorpark, CA 93021

T: 805/907-2747 FAX: 805/552-0911

Subcontractors

JPL Electric

No Bid Submitted

1532 Callens Rds.

Ventura, CA 93003

T: 805/650-6484 FAX: 805/650-6572

Subcontractors

J.W. Bailey Construction Co.

$243,480.00

$0.00

10

$0.00

$243,480.00

424 Olive Street

Santa Barbara, CA 93101

T: B05/963-1855 FAX: 805/965-9739

Subcontractors

Demolition, Excav. & Grading, Site Utilities:
MJ Ross Construction, Inc

AC Paving: Challenge Asphalt Inc

Rebar: Benkat & Son Steel Co.

Prefab. Bldg. Atlas Performance Industries, Inc.

Fencing: Santa Barbara Fence Co.

Gutters & Downspouts: Art Grossmann &
Sons, Cancelled, suspended

Electric: Taft Electric Company

Keller Construction

No Bid Submitted

10

6796 Pasado Rd.

Goleta, CA 93117

T: 805/708-3110 FAX: 805/8234902

Subcontractors

University Representative: Croft Yjader
Bid Opening Date: April 24, 2009 @ 2:30PM



Bid Summary

Assaociated Students Bike Shop Replacement
FM090262S8/987719

BASE BID

COMPENSABLE DELAY

TOTAL PROJECT COST

General Contractor

Base Bid

Compensable Total

Delay

Days|Compensable

Base Bid w/Compensable
Delays

Lack Construction

No Bid Submitted

10

420 East Carrillo Street

Santa Barbara, CA 93101

T: 805/963-3600 FAX: 805/963-6060

Subcontractors

Menchaca Construction

No Bid Submitted

10

50-11 Barranca Ave.

Santa Barbara, CA 931098

T: 805/886-3450 FAX: 805/884-6126

Subcontractors

Newton Construction & Management Inc.

$249,000.00

$0.00 10 $0.00

$249,000.00

PO Box 3260

San Luis Obispo, CA 93413

T: 805/544-5583 FAX: 805/544-5584

Subcontractors

Demo/Grading: C G |

Concrete: D A Craghead Construction Inc.

Pre Manufactured Bldg.: Atlas Performance
Industries, Inc.

Utilities/Paving: Dave Spurr Excavating Inc.

Electric: The Good Service Company

0zzimo Electric

No Bid Submitted

10

2350 A. Street

Santa Maria, CA 93455

T: 805/928-9741 FAX: B05/928-9765

Subcontractors

Profile Structures

No Bid Submitted

10

13926 Carmenita Rd.

Santa Fe Springs, CA 90670-4917

T: 562/921-25561 FAX: 562/921-2203

Subcontractors

Sansone Co.

No Bid Submitted

10

P.O. Box 1429

San Luis Obispo, CA 93406

T: B805/549-0667 FAX: 805/549-0702

Subcontractors

University Representative: Croft Yjader
Bid Opening Date: April 24, 2009 @ 2:30PM



Bid Summary
Associated Students Bike Shop Replacement
FM0902625/987719

BASE BID

COMPENSABLE DELAY

TOTAL PROJECT COST

General Contractor

Base Bid

Compensable
Delay

Days

Total

Compensable

Base Bid w/Compensable
Delays

Schock Contracting Corporation

$355,500.00

$100.00

10

$1,000.00

$356,500.00

PO Box 61565

Santa Barbara, CA 93160

T. 805/681-9796 FAX: B05/681-9717

Subcontractors

Demolgrading: Bischel Excavation dba R B
Excavation

Storm Drain: Sam Hill & Sons Inc

AC Paving: Granite Construction Company

Concrete: Anacapa Concrete Inc.

Metal Fab: Goleta Fabrication Inc. dba Precision

Welding

Prefab Modular Building: Atlas Performance
Industries, Inc.

Electrical: Taft Electric Company

Silver Creek Industries, Inc

No Bid Submitted

10

195 E. Morgan Street

Perris, CA 92571

T: 951/943-5393 FAX: 951/943-2211

Subcontractors

Tasco Construction Inc

$232,018.00

$0.00

10

$0.00

$232,018.00

651 Via Alondra, Ste 715

Camarillo, CA 93012

T: 805/987-1824 FAX: B805/389-0514

Subcontractors

Earthwork/Utilities: Rebar Landscape
Construction inc

Asphalt Paving: Landmark Grading & Quality
Paving dba Quality Paving

Fencing: Nu-Line Fence Co

Misc. Metals: Craftsmen Construction &
Erectors Corp

Modular Building: Atlas Performance
Industries, Inc.

Fire Alarm: Golden State Alarms Inc

Electrical: KME Electrical Contractors Inc

Concrete: D.A. Craghead Construction Inc

Suweying: MBS Land Surveys

Tomar Construction dba TJ Construction

No Bid Submitted

10

5304 Elmhurst St.

Ventura, CA 93003

T: B05/642-8816 FAX: 805/642-8817

Subcontractors

University Representative: Croft Yjader
Bid Opening Date: April 24, 2009 @ 2:30PM



