
Bid Summary
Fiesta Room Air Handler Retrofit

FM090264S/293-16
Estimated Construction Costs: $265,200.00

Project Manager: C. Yjader
Bid Opening Date: Wednesday,

May 20, 2009  @ 2:30PM

Contractor Base Bid
Compensable 

Delay Days
Total 

Compensable
Base Bid Plus Compensable 

Delays Total
Brannon Inc., DBA Smith Electric Service $206,348.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $206,348.00 $206,348.00
1340 W. Betteravia Road
Santa Maria, CA 93455
805/621-5000/ Fax 805/621-5050

Subcontractors
Susp. T-Bar Ceiling: Pacific Acoustics North Inc.
Roofing: Channel Islands Roofing Inc.
Air Balance: Los Angeles Air Balance Company Inc.
DDC Controls: Breen Automation Systems Inc.

Blum & Sons Electric No Bid Submitted 10
606 Linden Ave.
Carpinteria, CA 93013
805/684-1010/ Fax 805/684-2260

Subcontractors

Cornejo Construction No Bid Submitted 10
809 E. Carrillo Street
Santa Barbara, CA 93101
805/965-6404/ Fax 805/965-7644

Subcontractors

Dahl Air Conditioning, Inc. No Bid Submitted 10
30 S. La Patera Lane, Ste 9
Goleta, CA 93117
805/964-2002/ Fax 805/683-7654

Subcontractors

David Lack, DBA Lack Construction No Bid Submitted 10
420 E. Carrillo Street
Santa Barbara, CA 93101
805/963-3600/ Fax 805/963-6060

Subcontractors
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EJS Construction $208,500.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $208,500.00 $208,500.00
4191 Carpinteria Avae, Ste 7
Carpinteria, CA 93013
805/684-6381/ Fax 805/684-6312

Subcontractors:
Roof: Craig Roof Company Inc.
Ceiling: Pacific Acoustics North Inc.
HVAC: Dahl Air Conditioning Inc.
Electrical: Venco Electric Inc.

Environmental Heating & Air Conditioning Inc. $190,000.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $190,000.00 $190,000.00
821 N. Maulhardt Ave.
Oxnard, CA 93030
805/278-4425/ Fax 805/278-4420

Subcontractors
Controls: Breen Automation Systems Inc.
Roofing: Craig Roof Company Inc.
Electric: Taft Electric Company
Insulation: Karcher Insulation Inc.
Air Balance: Air Test & Balance Inc.
Coring: Penhall Company

J. W. Bailey Construction $249,897.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $249,897.00 $249,897.00
424 Olive Street
Santa Barbara, CA 93101
805/963-1855/ Fax 805-965-9739

Subcontractors
Acoustical:  Pacific Acoustics North Inc.
Roofing: Craig Roof Company Inc.
HVAC: Dahl Air Conditioning Inc.
Electric: Venco Electric Inc.
Saw Cutting: Newhard Concrete Sawing 
Rebar: Vista Steel Company
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Los Angeles Air Conditioning Inc. $210,000.00 $100.00 10 $1,000.00 $211,000.00 $211,000.00
1714 Lindbergh Court
La Verne, CA 91750
909/596-7077/ Fax 909/596-6657

Subcontractors
Insulation: Karcher Insulation Inc.
Controls: Breen Automation Systems Inc.
Air Balance: Penn Air Control Inc.
General Construction: Thomas O'Neill Construction
Electrical: Rymax Electric Inc.

Pacific Acoustics North, Inc. No Bid Submitted 10
133 East Ortega Street
Santa Barbara, CA 93101
805/963-1538/ Fax 805/564-7044

Subcontractors

SBS Corporation $192,588.39 $0.00 10 $0.00 $192,588.39 $192,588.39
31416 Agoura Road, Ste 135
Westlake, CA 91361
818/597-4363/ Fax 818/597-4368

Subcontractors
HVAC: Churchill's Heating & Air Conditioning Inc.
Electric: Venco Electric Inc.
Concrete:  Hughes General Engineering Inc.
Roofing: Cambron Roofing & Waterproofing Inc.
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Tasco Construction $167,746.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $167,746.00 $167,746.00
 651 Via Alondra,  Ste 715
Camarillo, CA 93012
805/987-1824/ Fax 805/389-0514

Subcontractors
Concrete Sawing: Eugene's Concrete Cutting Inc.
Concrete: Jacobsen Concrete Inc. DBA KJ Concrete Construction
Roofing: Craig Roof Company Inc.
T-Bar Ceiling: Acoustical Precision
HVAC: Churchill's Heating & Air Conditioning Inc.
Electrical: KME Electrical Contractors Inc.

KFY United Mechanical, DBA United Mechanical Contractors, Inc. $178,500.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $178,500.00 $178,500.00
794 E. Los Angeles Ave.
Simi Valley, CA 93065
805/583-1010/ Fax 805/582-1126

Subcontractors
Controls: Breen Automation Systems Inc.
Air Balance: Los Angeles Air Balance Company Inc.
Electrical: GM Elecrtric's
Concrete Cutting: Independent Concrete Cutting Inc.
Insulation: Kerco Inc.
Roofing: Camron Roofing & Waterproofing Inc.
Concrete: T & E Concrete
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