
Engineering II-Bldg. 503, Laboratory Remodel Rooms 1119B 1119E
Project No. FM090301S/987722

Estimated Construction Cost: $176,500.00
University Representative: Deedee Ciancola

TOTAL 
PROJECT COST

 General Contractor Base Bid
Compensable 
Delay Days

Total 
Compensable

Base Bid & 
Compensable 
Delays

Below Magid Construction Co.
146 Powers Ave. $175,319.00 $0.00 5 $0.00 $175,319.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93103
T:  805/966-3646    FAX:  805/966-0279

Subcontractors
Electrical- Blum & Sons Electric Attachment Plates- Goleta Fabrication
Roofing- Craig Roof Co. Flooring- Moor Flooring
HVAC- Dahl A/C Drywall Steel Stud Fram.- Thomas Drywall
Plumbing- M/M Mech.

Bottenfield Construction
24832 Apple St. 5 $0.00 $0.00
Newhall,  CA  91321 NO BID
T:  661/260-1720     FAX:  661/260-1401

Subcontractors

Carroll Construction
121 S. Quarantina 5 $0.00 $0.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93101 NO BID
T:    805/966-4810 FAX:  805/966-5654

Subcontractors

Cornejo Construction
809 E. Carrillo Street                  PO Box 22302 $126,625.00 $0.00 5 $0.00 $126,625.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93101          Santa Barbara, Ca 93121 
T:  805/965-6404    FAX:   805/965-7644

Subcontractors Electric- Blum & Sons Painting- Steve Ricci Painting
Steel Studs & Drywall- Pacific Acoustics Stainless Steel Plates- Precision Welding Sprinkler- RJ Fire Sprinklers
Plumbing- Goleta Plumbing & Mechanical Core Drill Demo Walls- I.C.C. Concrete- T&E Concrete
Door- Door Solutions, Inc. Flooring Covering- Cutis Carpets HVAC- Clean Air Mechanical
Insulation- Five Star Insulation Roofing- Craig Roofing

EJS Construction
4191 Carpinteria Avenue, Ste 7 $163,000.00 $0.00 5 $0.00 $163,000.00
Carpinteria, CA 93013
T:   805/684-6381   FAX:  805/684-6446

Subcontractors
Electric- Blum & Sons Paint- Mar Vista
Plumbing- Goleta Plumbing Floor- Moore Flooring
HVAC- Dahl A/C Roof- Craig Roofing
Drywall- Garibay Drywall

Frank Schipper Construction Co.
610 East Cota $153,482.00 $908.00 5 $4,540.00 $158,022.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93103
T:   805/963-4359   FAX: 805/963-1270

Subcontractors
Painting- Pacific Painting Drywall- AGS
Plumbing- Alpha
HVAC- Alpha
Electric- Blum Electric

BASE BID COMPENSABLE DELAY

Bid Open: 2:30PM, Friday, June 5, 2009
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J.W. Bailey Construction
424 Olive Street                         PO Box 506 $169,747.00 $0.00 5 $0.00 $169,747.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93101        Santa Barbara, CA 93102
T:    805/963-1855  FAX:  805/965-9739

Subcontractors
M. Studs & Drywall- Cassidy Const. Plumbing- Goleta Plumb.
Static control Vinyl Flooring- Curtis Carpet Electric- Blum & Sons
Painting- Guy Smithson Roofing- Craig Roof
HVAC & Air Balance- Dahl A/C

Kinyon Construction
4591 Merridock Court $134,337.00 $0.00 5 $0.00 $134,337.00
Santa Maria, CA 93455
T:   805/938-7990   FAX:  805/934-9500

Subcontractors
Electrical- Blum & Sons
HVAC- Top Notch
Flooring- Moore Flooring

SBS Corporation
31416 Agoura Rd. Suite 135 $212,248.00 $0.00 5 $0.00 $212,248.00
Westlake Village, CA 91361
T: 818/597-4363     FAX:  818/597-4368

Subcontractors
Painting- Vanguard Painting Electrical- Venco Electric
HVAC Dahl A/C Plumbing- M/M Mech.
Roofing- Craig Roof Co.
Flooring- Moor Flooring

Tasco Construction, Inc.
651 Via Alondra Suite 715 $124,881.00 $0.00 5 $0.00 $124,881.00
Camarillo, CA 93012
T: 805/987-1824     FAX: 805/389-0514

Subcontractors
Metal Fabrication- B & R Fabrication Painting- Termar
Roofing- Craig Roof Co. Plumbing- M/M Mechanical
Drywall CJR Construction HVAC- Churchill's Heating & Air
Flooring- Howard's Rug Co Electrical- Blum & Sons Electric

Tomar Construction Inc, DBA TJ Construction
5304 Elmhurst St. 5 $0.00 $0.00
Ventura, CA 93003 NO BID 
T:    805/642-8816  FAX:  805/642-8817

Subcontractors

Viola Constructors Inc.
1144 Commercial Ave.                       PO Box 5624 $133,000.00 $100.00 5 $500.00 $133,500.00
Oxnard, CA 93031                                Oxnard, CA 93030
T:  805/487-3871    FAX:  805/497-3870

Subcontractors Fire Stopping- Sierra Commercial HVAC- Dahl
Demo- M&T Concrete Metal Doors, Frames & Hardware- The Door Stop Electrical & Low Voltage- Blum &
Metal Fabrications- Goleta Fabrications Metal Studs & Drywall- AGS Wall Systems Sons Electric
Carpentry- M&T Concrete Resilient Flooring- Howards Rug Co. Roofing- Craig Roof Co.
Sheet Metal- Dahl Painting- Termar Inc.

Bid Open: 2:30PM, Friday, June 5, 2009
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Werner Tile & Construction Co., Inc.
22935 Ventura Blvd. 222 5 $0.00 $0.00
Woodland Hills, CA 91364 NO BID 
T:   818/222-5585   FAX: 818/222-5527

Subcontractors

Whitney Construction
10168 E. Artesia Place $173,797.00 $295.00 5 $1,475.00 $175,272.00
Bellflower, CA 90706
T: 562/920-3600     FAX:   562/920-3631

Subcontractors
Roofing- Craig Roofing Demo/Drywall- Senel Const.
HVAC- Dahl A/C Steel- Goleta Fabrication
Elect.- Vastola Elect. Life Safety- Simplex
Plumbing- Capital Plumbing (Gary Fenn)

Bid Open: 2:30PM, Friday, June 5, 2009


