
Project: Research Greenhouse
Project No. FM090158S/981530
University Representative: Croft Yjader

Estimated Construction Cost: $570,000.00

ALTERNATES

 General Contractor Base Bid
Compensable 
Delay Days

Total 
Compensable Alternate #1 Alternate #2

Base Bid & 
Compensable 
Delays Total Alternates 

Total with all 
Alternates

Brannon Inc. DBA Smith Electric Service (S-20)
1340 W. Betteravia Road $610,300.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $31,175.00 $34,344.00 $610,300.00 $65,519.00 $675,819.00
Santa Maria, CA 93455
T:   805/621-5000   FAX:  805/621-5050

Subcontractors
Demo/Excavation- Bob's Backhoe Service Fire Alarm- Simplex
Asphalt- Bob's Backhoe Service Site Utilities- Tierra Contracting 
Greenhouse- Nexus Corp Comm./Data- Pacificom

Channel Coast Corporation (H-6)
123 Santa Barbara Street 10 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93101 No Bid
T:  805/899-1227    FAX:  805/899-8690

Subcontractors

Dotzler Construction Inc., DBA North Coast Construction (B-2)
216 W. Walnut $656,670.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $53,300.00 $53,300.00 $656,670.00 $106,600.00 $763,270.00
Lompoc, CA 93436
T:   805/740-1227  FAX:  805/740-1727

Subcontractors
Greenhouse- Stupply Concrete- MT Co. Fencing- Magnum
Electrical-Blum & Sons AC Paving- Toste
Demo/Earthwork- Adobe Co. Site Utilities-Tierra

EJS Construction (K-8)
4191 Carpinteria Avenue, Ste 7 $559,000.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $19,394.00 $28,131.00 $559,000.00 $47,525.00 $606,525.00
Carpinteria, CA 91013
T: 805/684-6381     FAX: 805/684-6446

Subcontractors
Excavation-Adobe Co. Green House- Nexus Corp.   Paint- Raymac
Plumbing- M/M Mech. Asphalt- Toste   Steel- Vista Steel
Electrical- Blum & Sons Fencing- Magnum

Ferrari Development (W-11)
1350 Primavera Lane $613,900.00 $100.00 10 $1,000.00 $19,000.00 $22,000.00 $614,900.00 $41,000.00 $655,900.00
Nipomo, CA 93444
T: 805/929-1204    FAX: 805/929-3814

Subcontractors
Fencing- Fence Factory Underground Utilities/Concrete- California Coastal Devel.   Survey- EDA Design Professionals
Demo/Over-Ex- Pat Phelan Construction Electrical- Ozzimo Elec.   Greenhouse Supply/Install- Nexus Corp.
Paving- Toste Paving Plumbing- M/M Mech.

Hanly General Engineering Corp. (M-4)
3191 Mission Dr. $0.00 10 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Santa Ynez, CA 93460 No Bid
T:   805/688-3752   FAX: 805/688-7138

Subcontractors
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J.W. Bailey Construction (Z-5)
424 Olive Street                                           PO Box 5 $617,710.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $37,775.00 $38,775.00 $617,710.00 $76,550.00 $694,260.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93101                          SB, CA 93102
T:    805/963-1855  FAX: 805/965-9739

Subcontractors
Excav&Grading- Adobe Co. Painting- Guy Smithson   Plumbing- Goleta Plumbing   Electric&Fire Alarm- Blum&Sons
Site Utilities- Tierra Greenhouse- Nexus Corp.   HVAC- Nexus Corp.   Demolition-Abode Co.
Fencing- Fence Factory Greenhouse Controls- Brooks Electric Service   Rebar- Benkat

John Donaldson Construction (G-2)
2472 Eastman Ave. $684,804.00 $250.00 10 $2,500.00 $33,557.00 $34,857.00 $687,304.00 $68,414.00 $755,718.00
Ventura, CA 93003
T:  805/654-1359    FAX:  805/643-4043

Subcontractors
Demo&Grading- Adobe Co. Concrete- RM Murphy Bldg. & Concrete Electrical- Blum & Sons
Site Utilities- Tierra Contracting Greenhouse- Nexus Corp.
Asphalt Paving- Toste Grading & Pavement Environmental Control Systems- Brooks Electrical

Kifer Construction (Q-1)
101 Arnold Place Suite C $0.00 10 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Goleta, CA 93117 Left Blank Left Blank Left Blank
T:   805/683-7745   FAX: 805/3066

Subcontractors

Lack Construction (D-12)
420 East Carrillo Street $0.00 10 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93101 No Bid
T:    805/963-3600  FAX:  805/963-6060

Subcontractors

Lash Construction (A-9)
721 Carpinteria St.                                 PO Box 4640 $515,142.00 $1.00 10 $10.00 $55,900.00 $60,560.00 $515,152.00 $116,460.00 $631,612.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93103                  SB, CA 93140
T:  805/963-3553    FAX:  805/965-8189

Subcontractors
Rebar- Benkat & Son Plumbing- M/M Mechanical
Electric- Blum & Sons
Painting- Garcia Paint

M. Brewer Construction (P-5)
5547 Rushmore Street $0.00 10 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Ventura, CA 91003 No Bid
T:   805/844-6004   FAX:  805/650-9089

Subcontractors
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Newton Construction  (K-4)
259 Higuera Street $0.00 10 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
San Luis Obispo, CA  93401 No Bid
T:   805/544-5583   FAX:  805/544-5584

Subcontractors

S.J. Deferville Construction (I-7)
2520 Skyway Drive #B $697,000.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $59,290.00 $62,920.00 $697,000.00 $122,210.00 $819,210.00
Santa Maria, CA 93455
T:  805/925-2988    FAX: 805/346-2452

Subcontractors
Grading/Demo- Schwan Brothers Exc. Concrete- Silver Oaks Construction Plumbing- Kohler   Surveying- Fargen
Utilities- Tierra Contracting Chain-link Fencing&Gate- The Fence Factory Electrical- Blum & Sons   Greenhouse Inst.- Glen Kamie & Co.
Paving- Toste Grading & Paving Environmental Controls System- Brooks Electric Greenhouse (Materials Only)-Stuppy  Epoxy Flooring- Stamp Man (Alternates)

Specialty Const. Inc (B-14)
645 Clarion Ct. $0.00 10 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
San Luis Obispo, CA 93401 No Bid
T:  805/543-1706    FAX:  805/543-1722

Subcontractors

Spiess Construction (N-13)
1110 E. Clark Ave, Ste 210                       PO Box 28 $698,870.00 $100.00 10 $1,000.00 $82,000.00 $82,000.00 $699,870.00 $164,000.00 $863,870.00
Santa Maria, CA 93455                         SM, CA 93457
T:    805/937-5859  FAX:  805/934-4432

Subcontractors
Greenhouse - Glen Kamei & Co AC Paving- Coast Grading & Paving
Electrical- Blum & Son Elec. Corp Plumbing- RJ Carroll & Son
Environmental Control- Brooks Electric Service HVAC- All Weather Inc.

Vernon Edwards (T-22)
PO Box 5849 $0.00 10 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Santa Maria, CA 93456 No Bid
T:  805/614-9909    FAX:  805/614-9906

Subcontractors

Bid Open: 2:30 PM, April 17, 2009


