

BASE BID		COMPENSABLE DELAY			TOTAL PROJECT COST
General Contractor	Base Bid	Compensable Delay	Days	Total Compensable	Base Bid & Compensable Delays
<b>Blum &amp; Sons Electric</b>					
606 Linden Avenue	NO BID SUBMITTED		5		
Carpinteria, CA 93013					
T: 805/684-1010 FAX: 805/684-2260					
<b>Craig Roof Compan</b>					
132 Garden Street, "T1"	NO BID SUBMITTED		5		
Santa Barbara, CA 93101					
T: 805/966-5331 FAX: 805/962-1168					
Subcontractors					
<b>Cornejo Construction</b>					
809 E. Carrillo Street	NO BID SUBMITTED		5		
Santa Barbara, CA 93101					
T: 805/965-6404 FAX: 805/965-7644					
<b>Dahl Insulation</b>					
30 S. La patera Lane, Ste I	NO BID SUBMITTED		5		
Goleta, CA 93117					
T: 805/964-2002 FAX: 805/683-7654					
<b>Diani Building Corp.</b>					
295 North Blosser	NO BID SUBMITTED		5		
Santa Maria, CA					
T: 805/925-9533 FAX: 805/928-2150					
<b>Evans &amp; Sons Inc.</b>					
25812 Springbrook Avenue	NO BID SUBMITTED		5		
Santa Clarita, CA 91350					
T: 661/254-8787 FAX: 661/254-5959					

BASE BID		COMPENSABLE DELAY			TOTAL PROJECT COST
General Contractor	Base Bid	Compensable Delay	Days	Total Compensable	Base Bid & Compensable Delays
<b>Frank Schipper Construction</b>					
610 E. Cota	\$492,840.00	\$877.55	5	\$4,387.75	<b>\$497,227.75</b>
Santa Barbara, CA 93103					
T: 805/963-4359 FAX: 805/963-1270					
Subcontractors	Painting- Termar	Plumbing- M/M Mechanical			
Structural Steel- Central Machine	Resinous Floor- Acousitcal Concrete	Electrical- Venco			
Drywall- AGS	Fire Sprinkler- RJ Fire				
Acoustical- Pacific Acoustic North	HVAC- Barto				
<b>Goleta Plumbing</b>					
90 Santa Felicia Dr.	NO BID SUBMITTED		5		
Goleta, CA 93117					
T: 805/967-3502 FAX: 805/685-9992					
<b>J.W. Bailey Construction</b>					
424 Olive Street PO Box 506	\$524,000.00	\$0.00	5	\$0.00	<b>\$524,000.00</b>
Santa Barbara, CA 93101 SB, CA 93102					
T: 805/963-1855 FAX: 805/965-9739					
Subcontractors	Drywall & M Studs- Cassidy United	Painting- Guy Smithson		Plumbing- M/M Mechanical	
Cabinet & Countertop- Dow Diversified	Acoustic Ceiling- Cassidy United	SS Scullary Sink Unit- JW Bailey		Wet Piping- Tower Air	
Roofing-Cambron	Flooring & TS Base- Floor Connection	Fire Sprinklers- RJ Fire Sprinklers		Bldg. MGT System- Venco Elect.	
Fire Proofing- Karcher	Resinous Flooring- SB Surfacing	HVAC- Tower Air		Electric- Venco Electric	
<b>Kinyon Construction Inc.</b>					
4591 Merridock Court	\$467,109.00	\$0.00	5	\$0.00	<b>\$467,109.00</b>
Santa Maria, CA 93455					
T: 805/938-7990 FAX: 805/934-9500					
Subcontractors	Sprinklers- RJ Fire Sprinklers	Casework/Counter- ISEC		HVAC- JR Barto	
VCT Flooring- Floor Connection Inc.	Resinous Flooring- SB Surfacing	Drywall- Premire Drywall			
Electrical-Dodd's Electric	Metal Fabrication- J&D Fabricating	Acoustic Ceiling- Pacific Acoustic			
Painting- Picute Perfect Painting	Plumbing- M/M Mechanical	Roofing- Cambron Roofin			
<b>Lack Construction</b>					
420 East Carrillo Street	NO BID SUBMITTED		5		
Santa Barbara, CA 93101					
T: 805/963-3600 FAX: 805/963-6060					
<b>Newton Construction &amp; Management, Inc.</b>					
259 Higuera Street PO Box 3260	NO BID SUBMITTED		5		
San Luis Obispo, CA 93401 SLO, CA 93403					
T: 805/544-5583 FAX: 805/544-5584					

BASE BID		COMPENSABLE DELAY			TOTAL PROJECT COST
General Contractor	Base Bid	Compensable Delay	Days	Total Compensable	Base Bid & Compensable Delays
<b>Santa Barbara Surfacing</b>					
5907 Corta Street	NO BID SUBMITTED		5		
Goleta, CA 93117					
T: 805/683-4085 FAX: 805/683-3327					
<b>SBS Corporation</b>					
31416 Agoura Rd. Suite 135	\$541,982.00	\$100.00	5	\$500.00	<b>\$542,482.00</b>
Westlake Village, CA 91361					
T: 818/597-4363 FAX: 818/597-4368					
Subcontractors	Fire Protection- RJ Sprinkler	Epoxy Flooring- Stonehard			
Roofing- Cambron	Electrical- Valv Electric	HVAC- Churchills			
Painting- Termar	Millwork- Empire Stonewood	Metal Fab- Goleta Fabwork			
Acoustical- Pacific Acoutics	Plumbing- M/M Mech.				
<b>Schock Contracting</b>					
340 S. Kellogg, Ste J	NO BID SUBMITTED		5		
Goleta, CA 93117					
T: 805/681-9796 FAX: 805/681-9717					
<b>S. J. Deferville Construction</b>					
2520 Skyway Drive, "B"	NO BID SUBMITTED		5		
Santa Maria, CA 93455					
T: 805/925-2988 FAX: 805/346-2452					
<b>Tower Air</b>					
867 S. Kellogg, #B	NO BID SUBMITTED		5		
Goleta, CA 93117					
T: 805/681-0059 FAX: 805/681-0069					
<b>Viola Constructors</b>					
1144 Commercial Ave.	NO BID SUBMITTED		5		
Oxnard, CA 93031					
T: 805/487-3871 FAX: 805/487-3870					