
Phelps Creek Stormdrain Outfalls
FM100006S/987735

Estimated Construction Cost: $153.000.00
Bid Opening Dated: Monday, August 24, 2009 @ 2:30PM

Univ. Rep.: E. Brown

TOTAL PROJECT COST Qualification Packet
 General Contractor Base Bid Compensable Delay Days Total Compensable Base Bid  & Compensable Delays Yes/No

Blois Construction $157,926.08 $4,080.99 $20,404.95 $178,331.03 YES
3201 Sturgis Road/P.O. Box 672 5
Oxnard, CA 93030/93032-0762

T: 805/656-1432    FAX: 805/485-0338
Subcontractors

Rebar: C H P Steel
Survey: Benner & Carpenter

Brough Construction $148,552.00 $1,850.00 $9,250.00 $157,802.00 YES
634 Printz Raod 5
Arroyo Grande, CA 93420

T: 805/489-7779    FAX: 805/473-2479
Subcontractors

Rebar: Vista Steel

Hanly General Engineering Corp. $121,140.00 $0.00 $0.00 $121,140.00 YES
3191 Mission Drive 5
Santa Ynez, CA 93460

T: 805/688-3752     FAX: 805/688-7138
Subcontractors

Concrete Reinforcement: Vista Steel

Lash Construction Inc. $76,050.00 $25.00 $125.00 $76,175.00 YES
721 Carpineria Street/P.O. Box 4640 5
Santa Barbara, CA 93103/93140

T: 805/963-3553     FAX: 805/965-8189
Subcontractors

Rebar: Benkat & Son Steel Company

Mendez Concrete Inc. $119,943.00 $450.00 $2,250.00 $122,193.00 YES
1210 E. Santa Paula Street 5
Santa Paula, CA 93060

T:  805/525-8043    FAX: 805/525-8057
Subcontractors

Survey: Benner & Carpenter
Rebar: Vista Steel Company

BASE BID COMPENSABLE DELAY
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Shaw Contracting Inc. $95,750.00 $250.00 $1,250.00 $97,000.00 YES
6214 Casitas Pass Road/P.O. Box 171 5
Ventura, CA 93001/Carpinteria, CA 93014

T:   805/649-2107   FAX: 805/649-9338
Subcontractors

None

Specialty Construction Inc. $166,250.00 $1,000.00 $5,000.00 $171,250.00 YES
645 Clarion Court 5
San Luis Obispo, CA 93401

T:805/543-1706      FAX: 805/543-1722
Subcontractors

Rebar: Benkat & Son Steel Company

John Madonna Construction $124,100.00 $250.00 $1,250.00 $125,350.00 YES
12165 Los Osos Valley Road/P.O. Box 5310 5 Bid Rejected
San Luis Obispo CA 93401/93403

T: 805/543-7751     FAX: 805/543-7754
Subcontractors

None

Santa Barbara Plumbing Company $160,000.00 $100.00 $500.00 $160,500.00 YES
137 Ocean View Avenue 5 Bid Rejected
Carpinteria, CA 93013

T:  805/684-4787    FAX: 805/684-5630
Subcontractors

None

Spiess Construction Company, Inc. $144,800.00 $100.00 $500.00 $145,300.00 YES
1110 E. Clark Ave./P.O. Box 2849 5 Bid Rejected
Santa Maria, CA 93457

T:  805/937-5859    FAX: 805/934-4432
Subcontractors

None
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Tierra Contracting $60,750.00 $100.00 $500.00 $61,250.00 YES
5484 Overpass Road 5 Bid Rejected
Santa Barbara, CA 93111

T: 805/964-8747    FAX: 805/964-4438
Subcontractors

Survey: Gilmore Land Surveying

Toro Enterprises $144,575.00 $6,328.00 $31,640.00 $176,215.00 YES
P.O. Box 6285 5 Bid Rejected
Oxnard, CA 93031

T: 805/483-4515     FAX: 805/483-3635
Subcontractors

Survey: Benner & Carpenter
Rebar: C H P Steel
Clear & Grub: Reed Land Clearing

Aguilera Brothers Construction Inc. NO BID SUBMITTED
288 Country View court 5
Santa Paula, CA  93060

T:805/933-3067      FAX: 805/933-3079

Five Star Contractors NO BID SUBMITTED
550 E. Rancho Vista Blvd, Ste A 5
Palmdale, CA 93550

T:  661/947-9665    FAX: 661/267-1141

Hondo Engineering Inc NO BID SUBMITTED
42443 27th Street West 5
Lancaster, CA 93536

T: 66/943-5252    FAX: 661/943-5264

Sansone Company Inc. NO BID SUBMITTED
P.O. Box 1429 5
San Luis Obispo, CA 93406

T: 805/549-0667     FAX: 805/549-0702
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Schock Contracting NO BID SUBMITTED
340 S. Kellogg, Ste J 5
Goleta, Ca 93117

T:805/681-9796      FAX: 805/681-9717

Union Engineering NO BID SUBMITTED
P.O. Box 1000 5
Ventura, CA 93002

T:  805/648-3373    FAX: 805/648-6634
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