

Sedgwick Reserve Barn Restoration - REBID  
FM090165SR/130-10

Est. Construction Cost: 150,000.00  
University Representative: G. Levinthal

BASE BID		UNIT PRICES				COMPENSABLE DELAY			ALTERNATES			TOTAL PROJECT COST			
General Contractor	Base Bid	Unit Price	Unit Quantity	Description	Total Unit Price	Compensable Delay	Days	Total Compensable	Alternate #1	Alternate #2	Alternate #3	Base Bid w/unit prices & Compensable Delays	Base Bid + Alt. 2	Base Bid +Alt 2 & 3	Total with all Alternates, 1, 2, & 3
Below Magid Construction 146 Powers Ave Santa Barbara, CA 93103 T:805/966-3646 FAX: 805/966-0279 Subcontractors	No Bid Submitted		100 75 400	Linear Foot Rafter Tail Sq. Ft.			10								
Benoit Construction 521 N. Ontaire Road Santa Barbara, CA 93105 T: 805/682-2126 FAX: 805/682-2172 Subcontractors	No Bid Submitted		100 75 400	Linear Foot Rafter Tail Sq. Ft.			10								
Channel Coast Corporation 123 Santa Barbara Street Santa Barbara, CA 93101 T: 805/899-1227 FAX: 805/899-8690 Subcontractors	No Bid Submitted		100 75 400	Linear Foot Rafter Tail Sq. Ft.			10								
Cornejo Construction 809 E. Carrillo Street Santa Barbara, CA 93101 T:805/965-6404 FAX: 805/965-7644 Subcontractors	No Bid Submitted		100 75 400	Linear Foot Rafter Tail Sq. Ft.			10								
Craig Roofing 132 Garden Street Santa Barbara, CA 93101 T: 805/966-5331 FAX: 805/962-1188 Subcontractors	No Bid Submitted		100 75 400	Linear Foot Rafter Tail Sq. Ft.			10								
D. A. Craghead Construction 3765 S. Higuera Street. Ste 130 San Luis Obispo, CA 93401 T: 805/541-9027 FAX: 805/541-9047 Subcontractors	No Bid Submitted		100 75 400	Linear Foot Rafter Tail Sq. Ft.	\$0.00		10								

Sedgwick Reserve Barn Restoration - REBID  
FM090165SR/130-10

Est. Construction Cost: 150,000.00  
University Representative: G. Levinthal

BASE BID		UNIT PRICES				COMPENSABLE DELAY			ALTERNATES			TOTAL PROJECT COST			
General Contractor	Base Bid	Unit Price	Unit Quantity	Description	Total Unit Price	Compensable Delay	Days	Total Compensable	Alternate #1	Alternate #2	Alternate #3	Base Bid w/unit prices & Compensable Delays	Base Bid + Alt. 2	Base Bid +Alt 2 & 3	Total with all Alternates, 1, 2, & 3
Diani Building Corp. 295 North Blosser Santa Maria, CA 93456 T: 805/925-9533 FAX: 805/928-2150 Subcontractors	No Bid Submitted		100	Linear Foot			10								
			75	Rafter Tail											
			400	Sq. Ft.											
Easterday Construction Inc. 2930 Lomita Road Santa Barbara, CA 93105 T: 805/569-0184 FAX: 805/456-0604 Subcontractors	No Bid Submitted		100	Linear Foot			10								
			75	Rafter Tail											
			400	Sq. Ft.											
EJS Construction Inc. 4191 Carpintera Ave. , Ste 7 Carpinteria, CA 93013 T: 805/684-6381 FAX: 805/684-6312 Subcontractors <b>Paint:</b> Mar Vista Painting <b>Roof:</b> In-Line Sheet Metal Inc A CA Corp.	\$110,270.00	\$40.00	100	Linear Foot	\$4,000.00	\$0.00	10	\$0.00	Add \$26,000.00	No Change \$0.00	Add \$47,830.00	\$124,270.00	\$124,270.00	\$172,100.00	\$198,100.00
		\$80.00	75	Rafter Tail	\$6,000.00										
		\$10.00	400	Sq. Ft.	\$4,000.00										
Ferrari Development Inc. 1350 Primavera Lane Nipomo, CA 93444 T: 805/929-1204 FAX: 805/929-3814 Subcontractors	No Bid Submitted		100	Linear Foot			10								
			75	Rafter Tail											
			400	Sq. Ft.											
Frank Schipper Construction 610 E. Cota Street. Santa Barbara, CA 93103 T: 805/963-4359 FAX: 805/963-1270 Subcontractors	No Bid Submitted		100	Linear Foot			10								
			75	Rafter Tail											
			400	Sq. Ft.											
GLR Construction P.O. Box 2421 Orcutt CA 93457 T: 805/347-7860 FAX: 805/347-1999 Subcontractors	No Bid Submitted		100	Linear Foot			10								
			75	Rafter Tail											
			400	Sq. Ft.											

Sedgwick Reserve Barn Restoration - REBID  
 FM090165SR/130-10

Est. Construction Cost: 150,000.00  
 University Representative: G. Levinthal

BASE BID		UNIT PRICES				COMPENSABLE DELAY			ALTERNATES			TOTAL PROJECT COST			
General Contractor	Base Bid	Unit Price	Unit Quantity	Description	Total Unit Price	Compensable Delay	Days	Total Compensable	Alternate #1	Alternate #2	Alternate #3	Base Bid w/unit prices & Compensable Delays	Base Bid + Alt. 2	Base Bid +Alt 2 & 3	Total with all Alternates, 1, 2, & 3

Sedgwick Reserve Barn Restoration - REBID  
FM090165SR/130-10

Est. Construction Cost: 150,000.00  
University Representative: G. Levinthal

BASE BID		UNIT PRICES				COMPENSABLE DELAY			ALTERNATES			TOTAL PROJECT COST			
General Contractor	Base Bid	Unit Price	Unit Quantity	Description	Total Unit Price	Compensable Delay	Days	Total Compensable	Alternate #1	Alternate #2	Alternate #3	Base Bid w/unit prices & Compensable Delays	Base Bid + Alt. 2	Base Bid +Alt 2 & 3	Total with all Alternates, 1, 2, & 3
Halsell Builders 3130 Skyway Dr. Ste 601 Santa Maria, CA 93455	No Bid Submitted		100	Linear Foot			10								
			75	Rafter Tail											
			400	Sq. Ft.											
T: 805/928-8948 FAX: 805/928-1129 Subcontractors															
Hanly General Engineering Corp. 3191 Mission Dr. Santa Ynez, CA 93468	\$124,500.00	\$37.25	100	Linear Foot	\$3,725.00	\$0.00	10	\$0.00	Add \$21,320.00	Add \$1,000.00	Add \$40,000.00	\$134,750.00	\$135,750.00	\$175,750.00	\$197,070.00
		\$55.00	75	Rafter Tail	\$4,125.00										
		\$6.00	400	Sq. Ft.	\$2,400.00										
T: 805/688-3752 FAX: 805/688-7138 Subcontractors															
<b>Painting:</b> John Trojmer Painting <b>Metal Roof:</b> In-Line Metal Inc. A CA Corp.															
J. W. Bailey Construction 424 Olive Street Santa Barbara, CA 93101	No Bid Submitted		100	Linear Foot			10								
			75	Rafter Tail											
			400	Sq. Ft.											
T: 805/963-1855 FAX: 805/965-9739 Subcontractors															
Judson Builders 3911 N. Ventura Ave. Ventura, CA 93001	No Bid Submitted		100	Linear Foot			10								
			75	Rafter Tail											
			400	Sq. Ft.											
T: 805/643-9306 FAX: 805/643-9046 Subcontractors															
Kinyon Construction 4591 Merridock Court Santa Maria, CA 93455	\$208,167.00	\$39.53	100	Linear Foot	\$3,953.00	\$0.00	10	\$0.00	Add \$18,985.00	Add \$780.00	Add \$36,600.00	\$230,224.25	\$231,004.25	\$267,604.25	\$286,589.25
		\$81.39	75	Rafter Tail	\$6,104.25										
		\$30.00	400	Sq. Ft.	\$12,000.00										
T: 805/938-7990 FAX: 805/934-9500 Subcontractors															
<b>Roofing:</b> Top Notch Heating Inc.															
Lack Construction 420 East Carrillo Street Santa Barbara, CA 93101	No Bid Submitted		100	Linear Foot			10								
			75	Rafter Tail											
			400	Sq. Ft.											
T: 805/963-3600 FAX:805/963-6060 Subcontractors															

Sedgwick Reserve Barn Restoration - REBID  
 FM090165SR/130-10

Est. Construction Cost: 150,000.00  
 University Representative: G. Levinthal

BASE BID		UNIT PRICES				COMPENSABLE DELAY			ALTERNATES			TOTAL PROJECT COST			
General Contractor	Base Bid	Unit Price	Unit Quantity	Description	Total Unit Price	Compensable Delay	Days	Total Compensable	Alternate #1	Alternate #2	Alternate #3	Base Bid w/unit prices & Compensable Delays	Base Bid + Alt. 2	Base Bid +Alt 2 & 3	Total with all Alternates, 1, 2, & 3

Sedgwick Reserve Barn Restoration - REBID  
FM090165SR/130-10

Est. Construction Cost: 150,000.00  
University Representative: G. Levinthal

BASE BID		UNIT PRICES				COMPENSABLE DELAY			ALTERNATES			TOTAL PROJECT COST			
General Contractor	Base Bid	Unit Price	Unit Quantity	Description	Total Unit Price	Compensable Delay	Days	Total Compensable	Alternate #1	Alternate #2	Alternate #3	Base Bid w/unit prices & Compensable Delays	Base Bid + Alt. 2	Base Bid +Alt 2 & 3	Total with all Alternates, 1, 2, & 3
Loyal Development 5277 Telephone Road, C12-118 Ventura, CA 93003 T: 805/509-6479 FAX:805/484-0202 Subcontractors	\$199,000.00	\$40.00	100	Linear Foot	\$4,000.00	\$0.00	10	\$0.00	Add \$10,000.00	Add \$2,000.00	Add \$10,000.00	\$212,500.00	\$214,500.00	\$224,500.00	\$234,500.00
<b>None</b>		\$100.00	75	Rafter Tail	\$7,500.00										
		\$5.00	400	Sq. Ft.	\$2,000.00										
Newton Construction & Management P.O. Box 3260 San Luis Obispo, CA 93103 T: 805/544-5583 FAX: 805/544-5584 Subcontractors	No Bid Submitted		100	Linear Foot			10								
			75	Rafter Tail											
			400	Sq. Ft.											
Progressive Roofing 7922 Ostrow street San Diego, Ca 92111 T: 858/633-8226 FAX: 858/292-7805 Subcontractors	No Bid Submitted		100	Linear Foot			10								
			75	Rafter Tail											
			400	Sq. Ft.											
S. J. Deferville Construction 2520 Skyway Drive Santa Maria, CA 93455 T: 805/925-2988 FAX: 805/346-2452 Subcontractors	No Bid Submitted		100	Linear Foot			10								
			75	Rafter Tail											
			400	Sq. Ft.											
Schock Contracting 340 S. Kellogg, Ste J Goleta, CA 93117 T: 805/681-9796 FAX: 805/681-9717 Subcontractors	No Bid Submitted		100	Linear Foot			10								
			75	Rafter Tail											
			400	Sq. Ft.											

Sedgwick Reserve Barn Restoration - REBID  
FM090165SR/130-10

Est. Construction Cost: 150,000.00  
University Representative: G. Levinthal

BASE BID		UNIT PRICES				COMPENSABLE DELAY			ALTERNATES			TOTAL PROJECT COST			
General Contractor	Base Bid	Unit Price	Unit Quantity	Description	Total Unit Price	Compensable Delay	Days	Total Compensable	Alternate #1	Alternate #2	Alternate #3	Base Bid w/unit prices & Compensable Delays	Base Bid + Alt. 2	Base Bid +Alt 2 & 3	Total with all Alternates, 1, 2, & 3
Spiess Construction P.O. Box 2849 Santa Maria, CA 93457 T: 805/937-5859 FAX: 805/934-4432 Subcontractors	No Bid Submitted		100 75 400	Linear Foot Rafter Tail Sq. Ft.			10								
Tasco Construction 651 Via Alondra Ste 715 Camarillo, CA 93012 T: 805/987-1824 FAX: 805/389-0514 Subcontractors <b>Concrete:</b> Mendez Concrete Inc. <b>Lead Abatement:</b> Channel Coast Corporation <b>Framing:</b> West Coast Structures <b>Metal Roof:</b> Top Notch Heating Inc. <b>Painting:</b> Testa Painting	\$156,803.00	\$83.60 \$122.95 \$14.75	100 75 400	Linear Foot Rafter Tail Sq. Ft.	\$8,360.00 \$9,221.25 \$5,900.00	\$0.00	10	\$0.00	Add \$24,720.00	Add \$997.00	Add \$45,428.00	\$180,284.25	\$181,281.25	\$226,709.25	\$251,429.25
Viola Inc. 1144 Commercial Ave Oxnard, CA 93931 T:805/487-3871 FAX: 805/487-3870 Subcontractors	No Bid Submitted		100 75 400	Linear Foot Rafter Tail Sq. Ft.			10								
Wilson Builders 926 Topaz Ct. Ojai, CA 93023 T: 805/646-2579 FAX: 805/646-2483 Subcontractors	No Bid Submitted		100 75 400	Linear Foot Rafter Tail Sq. Ft.			10								