
2009 Mesa Parking Lighting Upgrade
FM100015S/166-30

Estimated Construction Cost: $95,000.00
Bid Opening Date: Tuesday, October 27, 2009 @ 2:30PM

University Representative: Mark Peppers

TOTAL PROJECT COST

 General Contractor Base Bid Unit Price
Unit 

Quantity Description Total Unit Price
Compensable 

Delay Days
Total 

Compensable

TOTAL  -  Base Bid w/unit 
prices & Compensable 
Delays

Brannon Inc., DBA Smith Electric Srv. $1,600.00 $106,721.38
1340 Betteravia Road $555.46 165 EACH $91,650.90 $0.00 5 $0.00
Santa Maria, CA 93455 $561.27 24 EACH $13,470.48
T: 805/621-5000     FAX: 805/621-5050

Subcontractors
None

Canaday Electric No Bid Submitted
4025 Drycreek Road 165 EACH 5
Paso Robles, CA  93446 24 EACH
T: 805/238-5510     FAX: 805/238-5510

Electricraft Inc. $0.00 $127,237.53
205 South Street $639.57 165 EACH $105,529.05 $0.00 5 $0.00
San Luis Obispo, CA 93401 $904.52 24 EACH $21,708.48

T: 805/544-8224     FAX: 805/544-0208
Subcontractors

None

Ferrari Development, Inc. No Bid Submitted
1350 Primavera Lane 165 EACH 5
Nipomo, CA 93444 24 EACH
T: 805/929-1204     FAX: 805/929-3814

JPL Electric No Bid Submitted
P.O. Box 4981 165 EACH 5
Ventura, CA 93007 24 EACH
T:  805/650-6484    FAX: 805/650-6572

Mike Mitchel Construction, Inc. No Bid Submitted
8220 Creston Road 165 EACH 5
Paso Robles, CA 93446 24 EACH
T:  805/237-9744    FAX: 805/237-0220

Newton Construction & Management Inc. $100.00 $122,725.00
259 Higuera Street      PO Box 3260   93403 $637.00 165 EACH $105,105.00 $0.00 5 $0.00
San Luis Obispo, CA 93401 $730.00 24 EACH $17,520.00
T:    805/544-5583  FAX:   805/544-5584

Subcontractors
None
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Oilfield Electric No Bid Submitted
1801 N. Ventura Ave. 165 EACH 5
Ventura, CA 93001 24 EACH
T:   805/645-3131   FAX: 805/648-4808

Pacific Electric and Solar No Bid Submitted
4464 Mc Grath Street, Ste 106 165 EACH 5
Ventura, CA 93003 24 EACH
T:   805/676-1029   FAX: 805/676-1057

Passmore Electric Company Inc. No Bid Submitted
2906 Tepusquet 165 EACH 5
Santa Maria, CA 93455 24 EACH
T:  805/937-5958    FAX: 805/934-3711

Pieroth Inc. dba Positive Energy No Bid Submitted
200 N. Glendora Ave, Ste H 165 EACH 5
Glendora, CA 91741 24 EACH
T: 626/914-6848     FAX: 626/914-0128

Schock Contracting No Bid Submitted
340 S. Kellogg, Ste, J 165 EACH 5
Goleta, CA 93117 24 EACH
T:   805/681-9796   FAX: 805/681-9717

Taft Electric Company $1,800.00 $113,019.00
350 Alamo Pintado Road, Ste 200 $583.00 165 EACH $96,195.00 $0.00 5 $0.00
Solvang, CA 93463 $626.00 24 EACH $15,024.00
T: 805/688-0121   FAX: 805/688-0125

Subcontractors
None

Lee Wilson Electric No Bid Submitted
1151 El Camino Real 165 EACH 5
Arroyo Grande, CA 93420 24 EACH
T: 805/489-4216    FAX: 805/489-0248
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