Phelps Hall North Wing Institutional Advancement Remodel

FM100035S/077-36

Estimated Construction Cost: $221.000.00
Bid Opening Date: Tuesday, November 3, 2009 @ 2:30PM
Project Manager: D. Ciancola

BASE BID

COMPENSABLE DELAY

TOTAL PROJECT COST

General Contractor

Base Bid

Compensable Delay | Days

Total Compensable

TOTAL - Base Bid & Compensable Delays

Blum & Sons Electric

No Bid Submitted

606 Linden Ave.

20

Carpinteria, Ca 93013

T: 805/684-1010  FAX: 805/684-2260

Brannon Inc., DBA Smith Electric Service

$115,700.00

$115,700.00

1340 W. Betteravia Road

$0.00

20

$0.00

Santa Maria, CA93455

T: 805/621-5055 FAX: 805/621-5190

Subcontractors

Painting: Guy Smithson Painting & Decorating Inc.

Abatement: Channel Coast Corp.

Ceiling: Pacific Acoustic North Inc.

Flooring: Floor Connection Inc.

Glazing: S. Coast Ind. DBA Santa Barbara Glass Co

Castlerock Environmental Inc.

No Bid Submitted

10010 Paianter Ave.

20

Santa Fe Spings, CA 90670

T: 562/941-9244 FAX: 562/961-9204

J.R. Barto

No Bid Submitted

300 N. "G" Street

20

Lompoc, CA 63436

T: 805/736-5160 FAX: 805/688-0321

EJS Construction Inc.

$123,800.00

$123,800.00

4191 Carpinteria Ave., #7

$0.00

20

$0.00

Carpinteria, CA 93013

T: 805/684-6381 FAX: 805/684-6312

Subcontractors

Abatement: Channel Coast Corp.

Metal: Goleta Fabrication Inc., DBA Precision Welding

Div 8 Store Front: S. Coast Ind. DBA Santa Barbara Glass Co.

Paint: Mar Vista Painting

Ceiling: Pacific Acoustics North Inc.

Drywall: Garibay Drywall Inc.

HVAC: Top Notch Heating Inc.

Electrical: The Good Service Company

Data: Pacificaom

Flooring: Curtis Carpet Inc.
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J.W. Bailey Construction

$139,657.00

$139,657.00

424 Olive Street

$0.00

20

$0.00

Santa Barbara, CA 93101

T: 805/963-1855 FAX: 805/965-9739

Subcontractors

Asbestos Abatement: Castlerock Enviromental Inc.

Aluminum Handrails: Goleta Fabrication Inc., DBA Precision Weld.

Aluminum Windows:S. Coast Ind., DBA Santa Barbara Glass Co.

Aluminum Doors/Frames: DBA Santa Barbara Glass Company

Glass & Glaze: DBA Santa Barbara Glass Company

Steel Studs/Drywall: Cassidy's United Construction

Acoustics: Cassidy's United Construction

Flooring:Curtis Carpet Inc.

Painting: Guy Smithson Painting & Decorating Inc.

HVAC/Air Balance: Art Grossmann & Sons

Electric: Venco Electric Inc.

Kinyon Construction

$238,883.00

$238,883.00

4591 Merridock Court

$0.00

20

$0.00

Santa Maria, CA 63455

T: 805/938-7990 FAX: 805/934-9500

Subcontractors

Windows/Alum Doors: Midi Inc., DBA Valley Glass & Mirror Co.

Demo/Asbestos Abatement: Castlerock Environmental Inc.

Handrail:Goleta Fabrication Inc., DBA Precision Welding

Acoustic Ceilings: Pacific Acoustic North Inc.

HVAC:Top Notch Heat ing Incorporated.

Painting:Santa Barbara Painting

Electrical/Comm: Venco Electric Inc.

Newton Construction Inc.

No Bid Submitted

P.O. Box 3260

20

San Luis Obispo, CA 93403

T: 805/544-5583  FAX: 805/544-5584

Pearl Bay Corporation

No Bid Submitted

912 De La Vina Street

20

Santa Barbara, CA 93101

T: 805/966-1480 FAX: 805/966-3401

Santa Barbara Painting, Inc.

No Bid Submitted

475 Cannon Green, "B"

20

Goleta, CA 93117

T: 805/685-3548 FAX: 805/684-2885
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SBS Corp.

No Bid Submitted

31416 Agoura Road, #135

20

Westlake Village, CA 91361

T: 818/597-4363 FAX: 818/597-4363

Specialized Environmental, Inc

No Bid Submitted

12115 Rivera Road

20

Whittier, CA 90606

T:562/698-9222  FAX: 562/698-9247

SRFS

$188,000.00

$188,000.00

1943 N. Campus Ave

$0.00 20

$0.00

Upland, CA 91784

T: 310/988-9322  FAX: 866/394-0900

Subcontractors

Flooring: Triple C Flooring Corporation

Electrical/Data Cable: D D P Electric

Abatement: Zenco Engineering Inc.

Painting: Born to Paint

HVAC: Tri-Dim Filter Corporation

Taft Electric

No Bid Submitted

1694 Eastman Ave.

20

Ventura, CA 93006

T: 805/642-0121 FAX: 805/654-7971

Testa Painting

No Bid Submitted

202 Highland Dr.

20

Pismo Beach, CA 93449

T:805/459-5906  FAX: 805/773-9800

Tomar Construction Inc, DBA TJ Construction

$197,470.00

$205,470.00

5304 Elmhurst St.

$400.00 20 $8,000.00

Ventura, CA 93003

T: 805/642-8816  FAX: 805/642-8817

Subcontractors

Electric: The Good Service Company

Data: Pacificom

Paint: Santa Barbara Painting

Mechanical: JR Barton Heating/AC/Sheet Metal Inc.

Abatement: Bohm Env. DBA Bohm Environmental Solutions

Metal Studs/Acoustic Ceiling: Herdez Acoustics

Zenco Engineering

No Bid Submitted

438 Calle San Pablo, Unit D

20

Camarillo, CA 93012

T: 805/482-2080 FAX: 805/482-1883
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