
Bid Summary
Tipton Meeting House/Completion Phase

FM100106L/981350

Estimated Construction Cost: $700,000.00
Bid Opengin Date: Tuesday, February 9, 2010 at 2:30PM

University Representative: Steve Eggemeyr

ALTERNATES TOTAL PROJECT COST

 General Contractor Base Bid Compensable Delay Days
Total 
Compensable Alternate #1 (Add)

Base Bid w/unit prices & 
Compensable Delays Total with all Alternates

A R J Construction Inc. No Bid Submitted
131 Second Street 10
Buellton,  CA 93427

T:   805/693-1330   FAX: 805/693-1330

BH Hildebrand Construction Inc. No Bid Submitted
P.O. Box 897 10
Santa Ynez, CA 93460

T:  805/705-3802    FAX: 805/201-2282

Brannon Inc., DBA Smith Electric Service $753,000.00 $79,299.00 $753,000.00 $832,299.00
1340 W. Betteravia Road $0.00 10 $0.00
Santa Maria, CA 93455

T:  805/621-5000   FAX: 805/621-5050
Subcontractors

Fire Sprinkler:Nargan Fire & Sagety Co. Inc.       Grade & Pave:   Granite Construction Co.      Structural Steel/Hand Rails:  Lahr Industrial Welding Inc.
Insulation:  Masco Contractor Services of CA Inc.    Ceramic Tile: Conception Tile Inc.    Painting:  Guy Smithson Painting & Decorating Inc.
Fire Alarms:  Simplex Ginnell LP      Casework: Superior Millwork of SB Inc.       Concrete Stain:  Dan Hemming Concrete  Controls:  Sacramento Cooling Systems Inc. DBA L & H Airco

Cannon Construction No Bid Submitted
17000 Ventura Blvd. 10
Encino, CA 91316

T:  818/906-6200    FAX: 818/9066220

Carl Lewis Construction Service No Bid Submitted
5950 State Street 10
Bakersfield, CA 93308

T:   661/213-3635   FAX: 661/213-3654

David A Odell Construction No Bid Submitted
2163 Rebild Dr. 10
Solvang, CA 93463

T:  805/688-1594    FAX: 805/688-1594
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Easterday Construction No Bid Submitted
2930 Lomita Rd 10
Santa Barbara, CA 93105

T:  805/896-9377    FAX: 805/569-0184

EJS Construction Inc. $775,600.00 $38,700.00 $775,600.00 $814,300.00
4191 Carpinteria Ave, #7 $0.00 10 $0.00
Carpinteria, CA 93013

T: 805/684-6381     FAX: 805/684-6312
Subcontractors

Asphalt: Challenge Asphalt Inc.           Striping/Signage: Interstate Striping & Signs INc.        Masonry: Glasspoole Masonrty Inc.        Welding:  Trinity Steel Corp. DBA Con-Sol Enterprises  
Cab/Counter:  Superior Millwork of SB Inc.       Insulation: Masco Contractor Services of CA Inc.      Window Coverings: Window Products Management inc. DBA Arjays Gotcha Covered       Drywall: Garibay Drywall Inc.      
Paint: Testa Painting   Tile: Lepell Tile & Stone INc.      Floor/Staining:  Floor Connection Inc.    Toilet Accessories: Stumbaugh & Assoc. Inc.       Plumbing: M/M Mechanical. In.  
HVAC: JR Barto Heating/Air Conditioning/Sheet Metal Inc.      Electrical: Cook Electric & Construction In.     Fire:  Simplex Ginnell LP      Communicaiton: Pacific Coast Sound & Communications Inc. DBA Pacificom   

Frank Schipper Construction Co. $828,400.00 $92,019.00 $833,300.00 $925,319.00
610 E. Cota $490.00 10 $4,900.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93103

T:  805/963-4359    FAX: 805/963-1270
Subcontractors

Finish Grading: Damar Construction Inc.     Roadway Completion/Reson Pavement:  General Pavement Management Inc.   Erosion Control:  Frank Schipper Construction Co.  
Concrete Polish, Stain: Santa Barbara Surfacing Inc.   Masonry:  Conception Tile Inc.   Metals:   Trinity Steel Corp, DBA Con-Sol Enterprises    Casework/Counters:  Superior Millwork of SB Inc.   
Insulation: Masco Contractor Services of CA Inc.   Sheet Metal/Flashing: Frank Schipper Construction Co.   Drywall: Thomas Drywall Inc.   Ceramic Tile: Conception Tile Inc.
Acoustical Treatment:  Frank Schipper Construction Co.    Carpet/Base:  Floor Connection Inc.  Bathroom Accessories:  Frank Schipper Construction Co.    Toilet Partitions: John Pence Bldg Spec. Inc.
Audio Visual: A M T Systems Inc.   Window Treatments:   Window Products Management Inc. DBA Arjays Gotcha Covered       Plumbing: M/M Mechanical            
HVAC: JR Barto Heating/Air Conditioning/Sheet Metal Inc.       Electric :  Venco Electric Inc.   Fire Alarms:   Simplex Ginnell LP      Finish Carpentry:   Frank Schipper Construction Co. 

Hanley General Engineering Corp. No Bid Submitted
3191 Mission Dr. 10
Santa Ynez, CA 93460

T:  805/688-3752    FAX: 805/688-7138

Kinyon Construction No Bid Submitted
4591 Merridock Ct. 10
Santa Maria, CA 93455

T:   805/938-7990   FAX: 805/934-9500
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Melchiori Construction Co. $738,451.00 $38,000.00 $742,951.00 $780,951.00
809 De La Vina Street $450.00 10 $4,500.00

Santa Barbara, CA 93101

T: 805/962-9505     FAX: 805/962-8776
Subcontractors

Earthwork: Damar Construction Inc.     Reson Pavement Walkways (Types 1 & 2): General Pavement Management Inc.   Site Drainage: Damar Construction Inc.  Metal Railing: Trinity Steel Corp., DBA Con-Sol Entrp. 
Finish Carpentry: B H Hildebrand Construction Inc.     Int. Millwork & Countertops: Superior Millwork of SB Inc.  Tile: Conception Tile Inc.   Concrete Floor, Polish & Stain: Santa Barbara Surfacing Inc.
Painting: Guy Smithson Painting & Decorating Inc.   Toilet Partitions & Accessories: Stumbaugh & Assoc. Inc.      Audio Visual Equipment:  Cook Electric & Construction Inc. 
Window Shades & Blinds: Window Products Management Inc. DBA Arjays Gotcha Covered     Domestic Plumbing:  M/M Mechanical Inc.   HVAC:   JR Barto Heating/Air Conditioning/Sheet Metal Inc.
Electrical: Cook Electric & Construction Inc.     Insulation:  Masco Contractor Services of CA Inc.     Carpet/Resilient Base:  Curtis Carpet Inc.     Drywall:  Thomas Drywall Inc. 
Alternate #1, Audio Visual:  Cooks Electric & Construction Inc. 

Newton Construction Inc. No Bid Submitted
P.O. Box 3260 10
San Luis Obispo, CA 93403

T:  805/544-5583    FAX: 805/544-5584

Remodel Pros Inc. No Bid Submitted
P.O. Box 404 10
Atascadero, CA 93422

T:  805/462-8100    FAX: 805/462-8100

SBS Corporation $765,308.00 $40,229.00 $765,308.00 $805,537.00
31416 Agoura Road $0.00 10 $0.00
Westlake Village, CA 91361

T:  818/597-4363    FAX: 818/597-4368
Subcontractors

Grading: Damar Construction Inc.       Paving: General Pavement Management Inc.   Drywall:  Garibay Drywall Inc.      Concrete Polishing: Santa Barbara Surfacing Inc. 
Structural Steel:  Trinity Steel Corp. DBA Con-Sol Enterprises     Insulation: Masco Contractor Services of CA. Inc.       Painting: Testa Painting       Ceramic Tile: Conception Tile, Inc.
Audio Visual System:   A M T Systems Inc.      Electrical:  Cook Electric & Construction Inc.   Mechanical:   JR Barto Heating/Air-Conditioning/Sheet Metal Inc.   Plumbing: M/M Mechanical
Rough & Finish Carpentry:  B H Hildebrand Construction Inc.
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Tasco Construction Inc. $748,149.00 $39,439.00 $749,149.00 $788,588.00
651 Via Alondra, Ste 715 $100.00 10 $1,000.00
Camarillo, CA  93012

T:  805/987-1824    FAX: 805/389-0514
Subcontractors

Paving: General Pavement Management Inc.      Stone: Peralez Masonry   Metal Handrails: Rincon Ironworks   Finish Carpentry:  B H Hildebrand Construction Inc.
Cabinetry: Superior Millwork of SB Inc.    Insulation:  Masco Contractor Services of Ca. Inc.   Drywall:  Garibay Drywall Inc.   Ceramic Tile: Conception Tile    Carpet/Base: Leslie Aron DBA LACO Floor Covering Co.
Painting: Testa Painting     Concrete Stain: Santa Barbara Surfacing Inc.     Toilet Partitions:Stumbaugh & Assoc. inc.      Roller Shades: Window Prod. Management Inc. DBA Arjays Gotcha Covered
Fire Alarm: Simplex Grinnell LP     Fire Sprinklers: Nargan Fire & Safety Co. Inc.   Plumbing:  M/M Mechanical Inc.  HVAC:  Dahl Air Conditioning Inc.   Electrical:  Cook Electric & Construciton Inc.
Alternate #1: Audio Visual:  Cook Electric & Construction Inc.

Western Group Inc. No Bid Submitted
21777 Ventura Blvd. 10
Woodland Hills, CA 91364

T:  818/884-5105    FAX: 818/884-4620

Urquidez Construction No Bid Submitted
P.O. Box 699 10
Los Olivos, CA 93441

T: 805/688-5654     FAX: 805/688-3085
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