Bid Summary
Lab Conversions, Rooms 1612, 1622, 1612A, 1511, 1614, 1645
FM100021S/987690

Construction Cost Estimate: $547,000.00

Bid Opening Date: Thursday, March 18, 2010 @ 2:30PM

Univ. Rep: Mark Schwartzback

BASE BID

COMPENSABLE DELAY

ALTERNATES

TOTAL PROJECT COST

General Contractor

Base Bid

Compensable Delay Days| Total Compensable

Alternate #1

Base Bid & Compensable Delays

Total with all
Alternates

Bottenfield Construction

No Bid Submitted

24852 Apple Street

5

Newhall, CA 91521

T: 661/260-1720 FAX: 661/260-1401

Subcontractors

Brannon Inc., DBA Smith Electric Service

$430,318.00

$6,700.00

$430,318.00

$437,018.00

1340 W. Betteravia Road

$0.00 5 $0.00

Santa Maria, CA 93455

T: 805/621-5055 FAX: 805/621-5190

Subcontractors

Lab Equipment: Dow Diversified Inc. Flooring: Floor Connection Inc. Painting:

Guy Smithson Painting & Decorating Inc.

Glazing: South Coast Industries Inc., DBA Santa Barbaraa Glass Company Air Balance: Los Angeles Air Balance Co. Inc.

C 3 Construction & Development

No Bid Submitted

560 6th Street

Paso Robles, CA 93446

T: 805/440-7106 FAX: 805/237-0225

Subcontractors

EJS Construction

$385,000.00

$17,500.00

$385,000.00

$402,500.00)

4191 Carpinteria Avenue, Ste 7

$0.00 5 $0.00

Carpinteria, CA 93013

BID REJECTED

T: 805/684-6381 FAX: 805/684-6446

Subcontractors

Casework: Dow Diversified Inc. Paint: Versicolor Painting Company Inc. Drywall: Garibay Drywall Inc. Flooring: Floor Connection Inc.

HVAC: Tower Air Inc. Plumbing: Koehler Plumbing Inc. Fire Sprinklers: Joy Equipment Protection Inc. Electrical: Blum & Sons Electrical Inc.

DATA: Pacific Coast Sound \& Communications inc., DBA Pacificom

This information has been reformatted from the original Bid Summary and is posted for information only.
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Frank Schipper Construction No Bid Submitted
610 East Cota 5
Santa Barbara, CA 93101
T: 805/963-4359 FAX: 805/963-1270

Subcontractors
J & P Construction No Bid Submitted
2310 "A" Street 5
Santa Maria, CA 93455
T: 805/352-1144 FAX: 805/352-1156

Subcontractors
JHK Contractors Inc. No Bid Submitted
1614 N. Catalina Street 5
Burbank, CA 91505
T: 818/521-7627  FAX: 818/273-4304

Subcontractors
J. W. Bailey Construction Company No Bid Submitted
P.O. Box 506 5
Santa Barbara, Ca 93102
T: 805/963-1855 FAX: 805/965-9739

Subcontractors

This information has been reformatted from the original Bid Summary and is posted for information only.
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Kinyon Construction

No Bid Submitted

4591 Merridock Court

Santa Maria, CA 93455

T: 805/938-7990  FAX: 805/934-9500

Subcontractors

Melchiori Construction

No Bid Submitted

809 De La Vina Street

Santa Barbara, CA 93101

T: 805/962-9505 FAX: 805/962-8776

Subcontractors

Newton Construction & Management Inc

$410,000.00

$9,000.00

$411,000.00

$420,000.00)

259 Higuera Street/P.O. Box 3260

$200.00 5 $1,000.00

San Luis Obispo, Ca 93401/93403

BID REJECTED

T: 805/544-5583  FAX: 805/544-5584

Subcontractors

Plumbing: Alpha Plumbing & Mechanical Inc. HVAC: Alpha Plumbing & Mechani

cal Inc. Flooring: Floor Connection Inc.

Electrical: Dodds Electric Plaster: SLO Plastering Inc. Casework: Dow Diversified Inc. Painting: Versicolor Painting Company Inc.

Dotzler Construction Inc. DBA North Coast Construction

$421,000.00

$6,500.00

$421,000.00

$427,500.00)

P.O. Box 824

$0.00 5 $0.00

Lompoc, CA 93438

T: 805/740-1227 FAX: 805/740-1724

Subcontractors

Lab Case Work: Lozano Caseworks Inc. Painting: California Pro Painting Inc., DBA CPPI Construction & Mechanical

Glazing: South Coast Industries Inc., DBA Santa Barbara Glass Co. Flooring: Floor Connection Inc. Plumbing: Koehler Plumbing Inc.

HVAC: Dahl Air Conditioning Inc. Electrical: Dodds Electric Demolition: West Coast & Sons's Drywall: ATI Construction

ALT #1, Electrical: Dodds Electric

This information has been reformatted from the original Bid Summary and is posted for information only.



Bid Summary Construction Cost Estimate: $547,000.00
Lab Conversions, Rooms 1612, 1622, 1612A, 1511, 1614, 1645 Bid Opening Date: Thursday, March 18, 2010 @ 2:30PM
FM100021S/987690 Univ. Rep: Mark Schwartzback
BASE BID COMPENSABLE DELAY ALTERNATES TOTAL PROJECT COST
Total with all
General Contractor Base Bid Compensable Delay Days| Total Compensable Alternate #1 Base Bid & Compensable Delays |Alternates
Onsite Construction No Bid Submitted
720 S. Frontage Road, #104-105 5
Nipomo, CA 93444
T: 805/929-0326 FAX: 805/929-0267
Subcontractors
SBS Corporation $449,335.00 $7,406.00 $449,335.00
31416 Agoura Road, Ste 135 $0.00 5 $0.00
Westlake Village, CA 91361
T: 818/597-4363 FAX: 818/597-4368
Subcontractors
Electrical: ACC & Sons Electric Inc.  Painting: Versicolor Painting Company Inc. Plumbing: Marseilles Plumbing Flooring: Floor Connection Inc.
HVAC: Infiniti Air Climate Control Inc. Fire Sprinklers: A-Plus Fire Protection Inc. Glazing: South Coast Industries Inc., DBA Santa Barbara Glass Co.
Drywall: Garibay Drywall Inc. Lab Casework: Dow Diversified Inc. Lath & Plaster: SLO Plastering inc.
S. J. Deferville Construction Inc. $383,000.00 $7,630.00 $387,125.00
2520 Skyway Drive Ste B $825.00 5 $4,125.00
Santa Maria, Ca 93455
T: 805/925-2988 FAX: 805/346-2452
Subcontractors
Casework: Lozano Casework Inc. Floor Covering: Floor Connection Inc. Painting: Lieberman Painting Inc. HVAC: Tower Air Inc.
Plumbing: Koehler Plumbing Inc. Fire Sprinklers: A-Plus Fire Protection Inc. Electrical: Dodd's Electric
Glass/Glazing: South Coast Industries Inc., DBA Santa Barbara Glass Co.
Tasco Construction No Bid Submitted
651 Via Alondra, Ste 715 5
Camarillo, CA 93012
T: 805/987-1824 FAX: 805/389-0514
Subcontractors

This information has been reformatted from the original Bid Summary and is posted for information only.
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