
Bid Summary
Cage Wash, Biological Sciences II, Bldg 571

FM090221L/981640

Construction Cost Estimate:$1.7 M
Bid Opening Date: Thursday, March 18, 2010 @ 2:30PM

Univ. Rep: James Gonzales

TOTAL PROJECT COST
 General Contractor Base Bid Compensable Delay Days Total Compensable Base Bid & Compensable Delays
AMG & Associates Inc.
26470 Ruether Ave, #108 $2,536,000.00 $450.00 15 $6,750.00 $2,542,750.00
Santa Clarita, CA 91350
T: 661/251-7401     FAX: 661/251-7405

Subcontractors Intumescent Fireproofing- Custom Spray Systems Inc. Sprinkler Sys- A-Plus Fire Protection Inc.
Haz.Mat. Abatement- Martix Env. Inc. Doors, Frames & Hardware- Handy One Srvs HVAC- Dahl A/C Inc.
Concrete Reinforcement- MCL Construction Plaster- Senel Construction Eng. Plumbing- Alpha Plumbing & Mechanical
Cast-in-Place Concrete- MCL Construction Gypsum Board Assemblies- Senel Construction Eng. Electrical-Oil Field Electric Co.
Structural Steel- So. Calif. Steel Inc. Flooring- Floor Seal Technology Inc.
Expansion Joints- Merit Metal Prod. Paints & Coatings- Versicolor Painting Comp. Inc
Cementitious & Reactive Waterproofing- SCD Coatings Inc.
Single Ply Membrane Roofing- Pacific Single Ply Roofing Inc. Fire Alarm & Detection Sys- Nelson Fire Systems Inc.

AWI Builders Inc.
2881 Saco St. $2,350,000.00 $0.00 15 $0.00 $2,350,000.00
Vernon, CA 90058
T: 323/589-5111     FAX: 323/585-2026

Subcontractors Cabinets- Artwood Design
Plumbing- Promp Plumbing Heating/Air Cond. Inc. Toilet Partitions, Accessories- Multi Scope
Low Voltage, Electric- Light from Above Glazing- Glass World
Doors, Window, Structural Steel-Construction Contractors
Demolition- Arrow Concrete Cutting Painting- Varn Painting
Roofing- Rey Crest Roofing Waterproofing Flooring- Doo Rite Painting
Mechanical- All Service Prime Enterp. Fire Protection- A Action Fire Protection
Concrete- Construction Contractors Lead, Asbestos- Asbestos Control Testing Inc.

Brannon Inc., DBA Smith Electric Service
1340 W. Betteravia Road $2,221,000.00 $0.00 15 $0.00 $2,221,000.00
Santa Maria, CA 93455
T: 805/621-5055    FAX: 805/621-5190

Subcontractors Roofing- Channel Island Roofing
Security- Security Signal Devices Inc. Framing Metal Studs- Tarlton & Son Inc.
Flooring- Floor Connection Fire Sprinklers- Nargan Fire & Safety Co. Inc.
Waterproofing & Epoxy Floors- SB Surfacing Controls- Johnson Controls
T-Bar Ceiling- Pacific Acoustic Air Balance- American Air Balance Co. Inc.
Abate & Demo- Matrix Environmental Inc. Fire Alarm- Golden State Alarm
Steel Structural- J&D Fabricating & Repair Inc. Fireproofing- Karcher Interior Systems Inc.
Painting- Guy Smithson Painting & Decorating Inc. Lath & Plaster- Talton & Son Inc.
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Cyrcon Builders
28406 Constellation Road NO BID SUBMITTED 15
Valencia, CA 91355
T: 661/295-3415     FAX: 661/295-9745 

Diani Building Corp.
295 N. Blosser Road NO BID SUBMITTED 15
Santa Maria, Ca 93456
T: 805/925-9533      FAX: 805/928-2150

Subcontractors

EJS Construction
4191 Carpinteria Avenue, Ste 7 NO BID SUBMITTED 15
Carpinteria, CA 93013
T:  805/684-6381    FAX: 805/684-6312 

Subcontractors

G2K Construction Inc.
17070 Encino Verde Pl. $2,486,000.00 $650.00 15 $9,750.00 $2,495,750.00
Encino, CA 91436
T:  818/889-6046    FAX: 818/889-6048

Subcontractors Acoustical Ceiling- CG Chaney Co
Asbestos, Lead Abatement- Karcher Environmental Flooring- Truewest  Carpet
Metals- Craftsmen Construction Fire Sprinkler- NST Fire Protection
Roofing- Westway Construction Plumbing- NST Fire Protection
Painting- Vanguard Painting HVAC- Dahl A/C
Concrete, Stucco, Drywall, Demo- Persa Construction Casework-5Star Cabinet
Electrical- Venco Electric Glass & Glazing- Aital Custom Glass & Mirror
Insulation- MD Insulation

H.A. Lewis Inc.
2126 Cotner Ave. NO BID SUBMITTED 15
Los Angeles, CA 90025
T: 310/478-1511     FAX: 310/477-2887

Subcontractors
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Harbor Construction
15550 Rockfield Blve, Ste B-100 NO BID SUBMITTED 15
Irvine, Ca 32613
T:  949/457-1888    FAX: 949/457-9888

Subcontractors

Kinyon Construction
4591 Merridock Court NO BID SUBMITTED 15
Santa Maria, CA 93455
T: 805/938-7990     FAX: 805/934-9500 

Subcontractors

Maino Construction Co
3599 Sueldo NO BID SUBMITTED 15
San Luis Obispo, CA 93401
T:  805/543-7411    FAX: 805/543-0514

Subcontractors

Melchiori Construction
809 De La Vina Street NO BID SUBMITTED 15
Santa Barbara, CA 93101
T:  805/962-9505    FAX: 805/962-8776

Subcontractors

Newton Construction  
259 Higuera Street NO BID SUBMITTED 15
San Luis Obispo, Ca 93401
T: 805/544-5583     FAX: 805/544-5584

This information has  been reformatted from the original Bid Summary is posted for information only.



Bid Summary
Cage Wash, Biological Sciences II, Bldg 571

FM090221L/981640

Construction Cost Estimate:$1.7 M
Bid Opening Date: Thursday, March 18, 2010 @ 2:30PM

Univ. Rep: James Gonzales

TOTAL PROJECT COST
 General Contractor Base Bid Compensable Delay Days Total Compensable Base Bid & Compensable Delays

BASE BID COMPENSABLE DELAY

SBS Corporation
31416 Agoura Road, Ste 135 $2,612,926.00 $500.00 15 $7,500.00 $2,620,426.00
Westlake Village, CA 91361
T:  818/597-4363    FAX: 818/597-4368

Subcontractors Roofing- Pacific Single Ply Roofing Plumbing- Koehler Plumbing
Sheet Metal- Mid-Land Sheet Metal Structural Concrete- BS Hand & Sons Lightweight Concrete- Cell-Crete Corp
Epoxy Resin Flooring- Stoncor Group Metal Stud Framing- Pacific Interiors Electrical- Venco Electric
Fire Sprinklers- A-Plus Fire Protection Drywall- Pacific Interiors HVAC- Dahl A/C
Abatement & Demolition- Sky Blue Environmental Lath & Plaster- Pacific Interiors
Fireproofing- Bay City Acoustical Ceilings- Woodward Acoustics
Cage Washer- Getinge Group Doors, Frames & Hardware- Spec. Bldgrs Hardware dba CFO Door Hardware & Security
Paint- Vanguard Paint Structural Steel- Craftsmen Construction

SCCI
P.O. Box 2849 NO BID SUBMITTED 15
Santa Maria, CA 93457
T:   805/937-5854   FAX: 805/734-4432

Subcontractors

S. J. Deferville Construction Inc.
2520 Skyway Drive Ste B NO BID SUBMITTED 15
Santa Maria, Ca 93455
T:  805/925-2988    FAX: 805/346-2452

Subcontractors

Specialty Construction Inc.
645 Clarion Court NO BID SUBMITTED 15
San Luis Obispo, CA 93401
T:  805/543-1706    FAX: 805/543-1722

Subcontractors

Tower General Contractors
10923 Randall Street, Ste E NO BID SUBMITTED 15
Sun Valley, CA 91352
T: 818/768-3530     FAX: 818/768-3534

Subcontractors
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Viola Inc.
1114 Commercial Ave./P.O. Box 5324 $2,261,000.00 $0.00 15 $0.00 $2,261,000.00
Oxnard, CA 93031/93030
T:  805/487-3871    FAX: 805/487-3870

Subcontractors Cementitious & Reactive Waterproofing- SB Surfacing Paints & Coatings- Versicolor Painting
Demo- Matrix Roofing- Channel Islands Fire Alarm & Detection Sys.- BergElectric Corp.
Asbestos & Lead Related Demo- Matrix Environmental Sheet Metal- Midland Sheet Metal Plumbing- Alpha Plumbing & Mechanical
Rebar- DJS General Contracting Cementitious Fireproofing- TFT Plastering H VAC- Dahl
Structural Concrete- DJS General Contracting Firestopping & Firesafing- Karcher Firestopping Inc. Building Management Sys.- Dahl
Structural Steel- So. Calif. Steel Lath & Gypsum/Cement- TFT Plastering Electrical & Low Voltage- BergElectric Corp
Metal Fabrication- So. Calif.Steel Gypsum Board Assemblies- AGS Wall Systems INc. Cage Wash Dismantle/Assemble- Getinge Group
Carpentry Misc. & Finish- M&T Concrete Concrete Floor Treatment- M&T Concrete Resinous Flooring- Floor Seal Tech.

W.E. Oneil
909 N. Sepulveda, Ste 400 NO BID SUBMITTED 15
El Segundo, CA 91245
T:  310/643-7900    FAX: 310/643-7900

Subcontractors

Western Group Inc.
21777 Ventura Blvd, Ste 224 NO BID SUBMITTED 15
Woodland Hills, CA 91364
T:  818/884-5105    FAX: 818/884-4620

Subcontractors
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