

Bid Summary
 Santa Rosa Residence Hall Landscaping
 FM100082S/293-29

Estimated Construction Cost: \$190,022.00
 Bid Opening Date: Wednesday, March 31, 2010 @ 2:30PM
 Univ. Rep: D. Ciancola

BASE BID		COMPENSABLE DELAY			ALTERNATES	TOTAL PROJECT COST	
General Contractor	Base Bid	Compensable Delay	Days	Total Compensable	Alternate #1	Base Bid w/unit prices & Compensable Delays	Total with all Alternates
Addison Landscape 21 N. Oakglen Ave Nipomo, CA 93444 T: 805/929-5603 FAX: 805/929-4712 Subcontractors	No Bid Submitted		20				
American Landscape 7013 Owensmouth Avenue Canoga Park, CA 91303 T: 818/999-2041 FAX: 818/884-4407 Subcontractors	\$123,067.00	\$50.00	20	\$1,000.00	\$9,184.00	\$124,067.00	\$133,251.00
NONE							
Belaire-West Landscape, Inc 4371 Walnut Avenue Buena Park, CA 90622 T: 714/523-9200 FAX: 714/523-9201 Subcontractors	\$125,000.00	\$500.00	20	\$10,000.00	\$250.00	\$135,000.00	\$135,250.00
NONE							
Cascade Sprinklers, Inc 177 Poindexter Avenue Moorepark, CA 93021 T: 805/529-4709 FAX: 805/529-4100 Subcontractors	No Bid Submitted		20				
Clean Cut Landscape 8405 N. Armstrong Clovis, CA 93619 T: 559/322-2041 FAX: 559/322-2071 Subcontractors	No Bid Submitted		20				
Cut 'n' Clean 536 Brookside Drive Lompoc, CA 93436 T: 805/735-7886 FAX: 805/735-7886 Subcontractors	No Bid Submitted		20				

Bid Summary
 Santa Rosa Residence Hall Landscaping
 FM100082S/293-29

Estimated Construction Cost: \$190,022.00
 Bid Opening Date: Wednesday, March 31, 2010 @ 2:30PM
 Univ. Rep: D. Ciancola

BASE BID		COMPENSABLE DELAY			ALTERNATES	TOTAL PROJECT COST	
General Contractor	Base Bid	Compensable Delay	Days	Total Compensable	Alternate #1	Base Bid w/unit prices & Compensable Delays	Total with all Alternates
David Johnson Landscaping	No Bid Submitted						
1213 Del Oro Avenue			20				
Santa Barbara, CA 93109							
T: 805/730-9145 FAX: 805/730-9133							
Subcontractors							
DLS Landscape Construction	\$171,000.00				\$0.00	\$173,000.00	\$173,000.00
79 Daily Drive, #104		\$100.00	20	\$2,000.00			
Camarillo, CA 93010							
T: 805/585-9001 FAX: 805/384-0593							
Subcontractors							
NONE							
Greenkeeper	\$183,000.00				\$12,400.00	\$183,000.00	\$195,400.00
3946 Foothill Road		\$0.00	20	\$0.00			
Santa Barbara, CA 93110							
T: 805/455-1081 FAX: 805/692-5004							
Subcontractors							
NONE							
IWL	\$158,400.00				\$10,700.00	\$158,400.00	\$169,100.00
P.O. Box 4669		\$0.00	20	\$0.00			
Santa Barbara, CA 93140							
T: 805/966-2907 FAX: 805/957-1947							
Subcontractors							
NONE							
J. D. Humann Landscape	No Bid Submitted						
2216 Skyway Dr			20				
Santa Maria, CA 93455							
T: 805/925-7744 FAX: 805/925-7877							
Subcontractors							

