
Bid Summary
Woodhouse Laboratory, Bldg 546, Room Numbers 1028 1028A, Renovations/HVAC

FM100147S/987746

Estimated Construction Cost: $132,214.00
Bid Opening Date: Thursday, April 8, 2010 @ 2:30PM

University Representative: Mark Schwartzbach
TOTAL PROJECT COST

 General Contractor Base Bid Compensable Delay Days Total Compensable
Total - Base Bid & Compensable 
Delays

Alpha Plumbing & Mechanical
4112 Glenview Dr. No Bid Submitted 5
Santa Maria, CA 93455

T: 805/614-2888     FAX: 805/614-9005
Subcontractors

Anderson Systems
5958 Corta Street No Bid Submitted 5
Goleta, CA 93117

T: 805/683-6133     FAX: 805/964-2359
Subcontractors

Brannon Inc., DBA Smith Electric Service
1340 W. Betteravia Rd. $116,328.00 $0.00 5 $0.00 $116,328.00
Santa Maria, CA 93455

T:  805/621-5000   FAX: 805/621-5050
Subcontractors

Acoustical Ceiling: Pacific Acoustics North Inc. Air Balance: Hartmanaire
Paint: Guy Smithson Painting & Decorating Inc. Flooring: Reliable Floor Covering Inc. 
Abate/Demo: Channel Coast Corporation
Controls: Johnson Controls Inc.

Channel Coast Corp. No Bid Submitted
123 Santa Barbara Street 5
Santa Barbara, CA 93101

T:  805/899-1227    FAX:  805/899-8690
Subcontractors
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Dahl Air Conditioning No Bid Submitted
30 S. La Patera Lane Suite 9 5
Goleta, Ca 93117

T:  805/962-2002    FAX: 805/683-7654
Subcontractors

Dodds Electric
251 Aldezaran Ave. No Bid Submitted 5
Lompoc, CA 93436

T:  805/733-2515    FAX:  805/733-2515
Subcontractors

Dotzler Construction, DBA North Coast Construction
P.O. Box 824 No Bid Submitted 5
Lompoc, CA  93434

T:  805/734-6761    FAX: 805/734-6763
Subcontractors

EJS Construction
4191 Carpinteria Avenue, Ste 7 $140,200.00 $0.00 5 $140,200.00
Carpinteria, CA  93013

T:   805/684-6381   FAX: 805/684-6446
Subcontractors

Asbestos: Channel Coast Corporation Ceiling: Pacific Acoustics North Inc.
Paint: Vanguard Paint Inc. HVAC: Tower Air Inc.
Flooring: Reliable Floor Covering Inc. Plumbing: Goleta Plumbing & Mechanical
Drywall: Garibay Drywall Inc. Electrical: Taylor Electric
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Goleta Plumbing & Mechanical
90 Santa Felicia Dr No Bid Submitted 5
Goleta, CA 93117

T: 805/967-3502     FAX: 805/685-9992
Subcontractors

JR Barto HVAC
300 North G Street No Bid Submitted 5
Lompoc, CA 93436

T:    805/736-5160  FAX: 805/737-0450
Subcontractors

J. W. Bailey Construction Company
P.O. Box 506 No Bid Submitted 5
Santa Barbara, CA 93102

T: 805/963-1855     FAX: 805/965-9789
Subcontractors

Kinyon Construction, Inc.
4591 Merridock Court $156,883.00 $0.00 5 $156,883.00
Santa Maria, CA 93455

T:  805/938-7990    FAX: 805/934-9500
Subcontractors

Painting: Guy Smithson Painting & Decorating Inc. Electrical: Dodds Electric
Abatement/Demo: Channel Coast Corporation HVAC: Tower Air Inc.
Acoustics: Pacific Acoustics North Inc. Carpentry/Drywall/Concrete: RK&G Construction
Flooring: Reliable Floor Covering Inc. Hydronic Piping: Goleta Plumbing & Mechanical
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M/M Mechanical Inc.
1027 Cindy Lane No Bid Submitted 5
Carpinteria, CA 93013

T: 805/745-1126     FAX: 805/745-1116
Subcontractors

MacCor Inc.
1755 Pancho Rd. $135,700.00 $0.00 5 $0.00 $135,700.00
Camarillo, CA 93012

T:  805/585-9001    FAX: 805/384-0500
Subcontractors

Electric: Oilfield Electric Company DBA Integrity Electric
Plumbing: Tri Valley Mechanical

Melchiori Construction
809 De La Vina Street No Bid Submitted 5
Santa Barbara, CA 93103

T:  805/962-9505    FAX: 805/962-8776
Subcontractors

Pavilion Construction
6720 SW Macadam Ave, Ste 310 $162,960.00 $850.00 5 $4,250.00 $167,210.00
Portland, OR    97219 

T:  805/896-0516    FAX: 805/832-6565
Subcontractors

Demolition/Abatement: Channel Coast Painting: Guy Smithson Painting & Decorating Inc.
Trim Carpentry: The Door Stop Plumbing: Continental Plumbing Inc.
Ceiling Suspension: Pacific Acoustics North Inc. HVAC: Tower Air Inc.
Resilient Flooring: Reliable Floor Covering Inc. Electrical: Oilfield Electric Company DBA Integrity Electric
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SBS Corporation 
31416 Agoura Road $162,844.00 $0.00 5 $0.00 $162,844.00
Westlake Village, CA 91361

T: 818/597-4313     FAX: 818/597-4318
Subcontractors

Electrical: Taylor Electric Drywall: Garibay Drywall Inc.
Flooring: Reliable Floor Covering Inc. Mechanical: Infiniti Air Climate control Inc.
Painting: Guy Smithson Painting & Decorating Inc. Abatement: Zenco Engineering Inc..
Acoustical Ceilings: Senel Construction Engineering

S.J. Deferville Construction
2520 Skyway Drive, "B" No Bid Submitted 5
Santa Maria, CA 93455

T: 805/925-2988     FAX: 805/349-6342
Subcontractors

SRFS Inc.
1943 N. Campus Ave, B207 No Bid Submitted 5
Upland , CA 91784

T:  310/988-9322   FAX: 866/394-6900
Subcontractors

Urquidez Construction Inc.
P.O. Box 699 No Bid Submitted 5
Los Olivos, CA 93441

T: 805/688-5654      FAX: 805/688-3085
Subcontractors
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Vision Communications
1421 State Street No Bid Submitted 5
Santa Barbara, CA 93101

T:  805/690-4411    FAX: 805/963-7673
Subcontractors

West Coast Mechanical
728 Union Ave, Suite B No Bid Submitted 5
Santa Barbara, CA 93103

T:  805/966-0501    FAX: 805/966-0520
Subcontractors
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