
Infrastructure Renewal Phase 1A
Project No.:  FM090074L/986080 
University Representative: Frank Castanha

Estimated Construction Cost: $4,460,000.00

ALTERNATES

 General Contractor Base Bid Unit Price
Unit 
Quantity Description Total Unit Price

Compensable 
Delay Days

Total 
Compensable Alternate #1 Alternate #2 Alternate #3 Alternate #4 Alternate #5 Alternate #6 Alternate #7

Base Bid w/unit 
prices & 
Compensable 
Delays Total Alternates 

Total with all 
Alternates

ARB, Inc. (B-19)
26000 Commercentre Drive $6,702,567.00 $4,950.00 5 Per Each $24,750.00 $4,325.00 20 $86,500.00 $35,431.00 $80,910.00 $265,000.00 $207,208.00 $76,104.00 $37,764.00 $30,000.00 $6,835,817.00 $732,417.00 $7,568,234.00
Lake Forest, CA  92620 $1,100.00 20 Per Each $22,000.00
T:    949/598-9242  FAX:  949/595-5526

Subcontractors Paver Installation- Rock Solid Creations
S/D Structures-DI Construction Concrete Structures- Precon Products $46,750.00
Concrete Flat Work- DennCo Construction
Landscaper- Marina Landscape

Blois Construction (B-15)
3201 Sturgis Road $4,368,750.00 $7,900.00 5 Per Each $39,500.00 $2,625.00 20 $52,500.00 $94,000.00 $466,900.00 $337,200.00 $268,200.00 $127,660.00 $21,600.00 $45,275.00 $4,481,250.00 $1,360,835.00 $5,842,085.00
Oxnard, CA 93030 $1,025.00 20 Per Each $20,500.00
T:    805/656-1432  FAX:  805/485-0338 Sub's for Alternates:

Subcontractors Boring- Golden State Boring Alt. 2 Pavers- Alpha & Omega
Pavers- Alpha & Omega Inc. Electric- Taft Electric $60,000.00 Alt. 1 & 7 Landscaping- Marina Landscaping
Survey- Benner & Carpenter Dewatering- Viking Drilling Alt. 1 - Electrical- Taft Electric
Landscaping- Marina Landscaping Alt. 1, 3, 4 &5 Survey- Benmer & Carpenter

D-Kal Engineering Inc. (V-8)
538 Country Lane $3,688,186.00 $6,500.00 5 Per Each $32,500.00 $287.00 20 $5,740.00 $72,275.00 $93,104.00 $161,092.00 $194,432.00 $94,866.00 $37,202.00 $24,255.00 $3,749,426.00 $677,226.00 $4,426,652.00
San Luis Obispo, CA  93406 $1,150.00 20 $23,000.00
T: 805/543-7758    FAX:  805/543-7759

Subcontractors Manhole Coatings- Protech Coatings
Landscaping, Irrigation, Erosion Control , Trees- Marina Landscaping $55,500.00
Electrical- Venco Electric
Pavers- Rock Solid Creations

Granite Construction Company (I-7)
5335 Debbie Lane $0.00 5 Per Each $0.00 $0.00 20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93111 NO BID RECEIVED $0.00 20 Per Each $0.00
T:   805/964-9951   FAX:  805/964-7661

Subcontractors
$0.00

Hanly General Engineering Corp. (R-3)
3191 Mission Dr. $0.00 5 Per Each $0.00 $0.00 20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Santa Ynez, CA 93463 NO BID RECEIVED $0.00 20 Per Each $0.00
T: 805/688-3752     FAX:  805/688-7138

Subcontractors
$0.00

John Madonna Construction Co. Inc. (O-7)
12165 Los Osos Valley Road $0.00 5 Per Each $0.00 $0.00 20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
San Luis Obispo, CA 93405 NO BID RECEIVED $0.00 20 Per Each $0.00
T:   805/543-7751   FAX:  805/543-7754

Subcontractors
$0.00
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Lash Construction - (G-4)
721 Carpinteria St.                                PO Box 4640 $4,216,000.00 $4,300.00 5 Per Each $21,500.00 $725.00 20 $14,500.00 $60,000.00 $86,000.00 $237,000.00 $196,000.00 $122,000.00 $37,000.00 $25,700.00 $4,262,400.00 $763,700.00 $5,026,100.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93103                 93140 $520.00 20 Per Each $10,400.00
T:   805/963-3553   FAX:  805/965-8189

Subcontractors Boring- Golden State Boring
Surveying- Benner & Carpenter $31,900.00
Electrical- Taft Electric
Landscaping- Marina Landscape

MGE Underground (A-9)
816 26th Street                                      PO Box 4189 $6,086,440.37 $6,203.36 5 Per Each $31,016.80 $2,000.00 20 $40,000.00 $97,128.29 $119,592.34 $680,990.92 $348,461.80 $263,116.40 $42,002.52 $26,385.59 $6,196,760.77 $1,577,677.86 $7,774,438.63
Paso Robles, CA 93446                  93446 $1,965.18 20 Per Each $39,303.60
T:    805/238-3510  FAX:  805/238-1975

Subcontractors Landscaping- Marina
Decorative Pavers- Pyramid Jack & Bore- Golden State Boring $70,320.40
Electrical- Taft Electric
Concrete/Paving- Gold Coast

Minako America Corp dba MINCO Construction (S-5)
522 E. Airline Way $3,717,700.00 $10,000.00 5 Per Each $50,000.00 $100.00 20 $2,000.00 $53,000.00 $223,000.00 $187,000.00 $177,000.00 $137,000.00 $50,000.00 $40,000.00 $3,909,700.00 $867,000.00 $4,776,700.00
Gardena, CA 90248 $7,000.00 20 Per Each $140,000.00
T:  310/516-8100    FAX:  310/516-7404

Subcontractors
Dewatering- Viking Drillers Inc. $190,000.00
Planting & Irrigation- Marina Landscape Inc.

Morillo Construction, Inc. (K-4)
227 N. Holliston Ave. $0.00 5 Per Each $0.00 $0.00 20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Pasadena, CA 91106 NO BID RECEIVED $0.00 20 Per Each $0.00
T:   626/796-3800   FAX:  626/792-4669

Subcontractors
$0.00

R. Burke Corporation (L-9)
865 Capitolio Way $0.00 5 Per Each $0.00 $0.00 20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
San Luis Obispo, CA 93401 NO BID RECEIVED $0.00 20 Per Each $0.00
T:  805/543-8568      FAX:  805/543-2521

Subcontractors
$0.00

SBS Corporation Q-1
31416 Agoura Road, Suite 135 $0.00 5 Per Each $0.00 $0.00 20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Westlake Village, CA 91361 NO BID RECEIVED $0.00 20 Per Each $0.00
T:    818/597-4363  FAX:  818/597-4368

Subcontractors
$0.00
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Schock Contracting (V-7)
340 S. Kellogg, Ste J $0.00 5 Per Each $0.00 $0.00 20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Goleta, CA 93117 NO BID RECEIVED $0.00 20 Per Each $0.00
T:   805/681-9796   FAX:  805/681-9717

Subcontractors
$0.00

Specialty Construction Inc. (O-13)
645 Clarion Court $5,314,313.00 $5,400.00 5 Per Each $27,000.00 $2,000.00 20 $40,000.00 $39,950.00 $91,700.00 $182,000.00 $124,000.00 $165,000.00 $37,000.00 $31,000.00 $5,465,313.00 $670,650.00 $6,135,963.00
San Luis Obispo, CA 93401 $4,200.00 20 Per Each $84,000.00
T:  805/543-1706    FAX:  805/543-1722

Subcontractors Storm drain Main hole- Precon Products
Pavers- CML Construction Electrical- Taft Electric $111,000.00
Storm drains (Partial)- Goldenstate Boring Gas (Partial)- Tap Master, Inc.
Landscape- Marina Landscape Inc.

Steve Bubalo Construction (W-7)
1286 Live Oak $0.00 5 Per Each $0.00 $0.00 20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Monrovia, CA 91017 NO BID RECEIVED $0.00 20 Per Each $0.00
T:   626/574-7570   FAX: 

Subcontractors
$0.00

Tierra Contracting (E-15)
5484 Overpass Road              PO Box 400 $4,550,000.00 $2,500.00 5 Per Each $12,500.00 $250.00 20 $5,000.00 $81,200.00 $86,200.00 $211,000.00 $256,800.00 $117,600.00 $36,000.00 $25,000.00 $4,573,500.00 $813,800.00 $5,387,300.00
Santa Barbara,  CA 93111       Goleta, CA 93116 $300.00 20 Per Each $6,000.00
T:  805/964-8747    FAX:  805/964-4438

Subcontractors Concrete- Dennco
Survey- Penfield & Smith Shoring- Trench Shoring $18,500.00
Electrical-Taft Electric Sawcut-True-cut Concrete
Landscape- Marina Pavers- Rock Solid Creations

Underground Construction Co., Inc. (T-6)
5145 Industrial Way $5,247,800.00 $11,540.00 5 Per Each $57,700.00 $5,422.00 20 $108,440.00 $87,720.00 $103,770.00 $397,840.00 $408,550.00 $268,980.00 $46,130.00 $28,875.00 $5,507,940.00 $1,341,865.00 $6,849,805.00
Benicia, CA 94510 $4,700.00 20 Per Each $94,000.00
T:   707/746-8800   FAX:  707/746-1314 Sub's for Alternates: Alt.2 Pavers- Rock Solid Creations

Subcontractors Concrete/Paving- Gold Coast General Engineering Alt.1 Electrical- Taft Electric Alt. 3 Concrete/Paving- Gold Coast General Eng.
Pavers- Rock Solid Creations $151,700.00 Alt. 1 Concrete/Paving-Gold Coast General Eng. Alt. 4 Survey- Penfield & Smith
Electrical- Taft Electric Alt. 1 Landscaping- Marina Landscape Inc. Alt. 5 Concrete/Paving- Gold Coast General Eng.
Landscaping- Marina Landscape Inc. Alt. 1 Survey- Penfield & Smith Alt. 7 Landscaping- Marina Landscape Inc.

V. Lopez Jr. & Sons (X-8)
200 E. Fesler, Ste 101 $0.00 5 Per Each $0.00 $0.00 20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Santa Maria, CA 93454 NO BID RECEIVED $0.00 20 Per Each $0.00
T:   805/928-1179   FAX:  805/928-8262

Subcontractors
$0.00

Bid Open: 2:30, May 27, 2010


