
Chilled Water Main (Events Center to Ocean Road)
FM100181L/118-80

Estimated Construction Cost: $910,000.00
Bid Opening Date: Wednesday, May 19, 2010 @ 2:30PM

Univl Rep.: T. Foster

TOTAL PROJECT COST

 General Contractor Base Bid Compensable Delay Days Total Compensable
Base Bid  & Compensable 
Delays

Blois Construction $877,583.00 $903,033.00
3201 Sturgis Road $5,090.00 5 $25,450.00
Oxnard, CA 93030

T:805/656-1432      FAX: 805/485-0338
Subcontractors

Survey: Penfield & Smith
Electrical: Taft Electric Company

Braughton Construction No Bid Submitted
10722 Arrow Route 5
Rancho Cucamonga, CA 91730

T: 909/481-6135     FAX: 909/481-6136 

E A R Engineering, Construction & Support Srv No Bid Submitted
4097 Trail Creek Road 5
Riverside, CA 92505

T:  951/324-8060    FAX: 951/324-8061

BASE BID COMPENSABLE DELAY



Chilled Water Main (Events Center to Ocean Road)
FM100181L/118-80

Estimated Construction Cost: $910,000.00
Bid Opening Date: Wednesday, May 19, 2010 @ 2:30PM

Univl Rep.: T. Foster

IWL No Bid Submitted
P.O. Box 4669 5
Santa Barbara, CA 93140

T: 805/966-2907     FAX: 805/957-1947

Hanly General Engineering Corp. No Bid Submitted
3191 Mission Drive 5
Santa Ynez, CA 93460

T:  805/688-3752    FAX: 805/688-7138

Lash Construction $865,124.00 $870,124.00
721 Carpinteria Street $1,000.00 5 $5,000.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93103

T: 805/963-3553     FAX: 805/965-8134
Subcontractors

None



Chilled Water Main (Events Center to Ocean Road)
FM100181L/118-80

Estimated Construction Cost: $910,000.00
Bid Opening Date: Wednesday, May 19, 2010 @ 2:30PM

Univl Rep.: T. Foster

LDM Plumbing & Mechanical No Bid Submitted
2043 Greenwood Rd. 5
Santa Maria, CA 93455

T: 805/349-7100     FAX: 805/349-7122

MGE Underground $647,302.00 $657,302.00
P.O. Box 4189/816 26th Street $2,000.00 5 $10,000.00
Paso Robles, CA 93477/93446

T:  805/238-3510    FAX: 805/238-1975
Subcontractors

Surrey Seal: Roy Allen Slurry Seal Inc.

North Coast Construction No Bid Submitted
216 W. Walnut 5
Lompoc, CA 93436

T:  805/734-6761    FAX: 805/734-6763



Chilled Water Main (Events Center to Ocean Road)
FM100181L/118-80

Estimated Construction Cost: $910,000.00
Bid Opening Date: Wednesday, May 19, 2010 @ 2:30PM

Univl Rep.: T. Foster

Riverside Construction Company Inc. $1,189,000.00 $1,219,000.00
P.O. Box 1146/111 North Main Street $6,000.00 5 $30,000.00
Riverside, CA 92502/92501

T: 951/682-8303     FAX: 951/682-8350
Subcontractors

Piping:  Renshaw Plumbing & Mechanical   Electrical:  Taft Electric Company
Slurry Seal: Glick Corp DBA Asphalt Maintenance Company of California
Millworks: Dunkel Bros Machinery Moving Inc.    
Asphalt Patch/Backhoe & Excavation: Coastal Construction 
Mech. Insulation: Consolidated Western Contractors Inc.   

Schock Contracting No Bid Submitted
340 S. Kellogg, Ste J 5
Goleta, Ca 93117

T: 805/681-9796     FAX: 805/681-9717

Specialty Construction Inc. $769,000.00 $771,000.00
645 Clarion Court $400.00 5 $2,000.00
San Luis Obispo, CA 93401

T:  805/543-1706    FAX: 805/543-1722
Subcontractors

Slurry Seal: Roy Allan Slurry Seal Inc.
Electrical/Loop Traffic: Taft Electric Company



Chilled Water Main (Events Center to Ocean Road)
FM100181L/118-80

Estimated Construction Cost: $910,000.00
Bid Opening Date: Wednesday, May 19, 2010 @ 2:30PM

Univl Rep.: T. Foster

Tierra Contracting $625,700.00 $625,950.00
P.O. Box 400/5484 Overpass Road $50.00 5 $250.00
Santa Barbara , CA 93116/93111

T: 805/964-8747     FAX: 805/964-4438
Subcontractors

Survey: Fleming Survey
Sawcut: True-cut Concrete cutting sawing & Breaking
Electrical: Taft Electric Company
Mechanical: Anderson Plumbing DBA Anderson  Systems

Turf Construction Inc. No Bid Submitted
1535 Flynn Road 5

Camarillo, CA 93012

T:   805/482-9876   FAX: 805/987-7447

Underground Construction Co., Inc. $850,550.00 $850,550.00
5145 Industrial Way $5,155.00 5 $25,775.00
Benicia, CA 94510 

T:   707/746-8800   FAX: 707/746-1314
Subcontractors

Slurry Seal: Roy Allen Slurry Seal Inc.
Electrical: Taft Electric Company
Paving: DP Mangan Inc. DBA Pave West



Chilled Water Main (Events Center to Ocean Road)
FM100181L/118-80

Estimated Construction Cost: $910,000.00
Bid Opening Date: Wednesday, May 19, 2010 @ 2:30PM

Univl Rep.: T. Foster

Vinciguerra Construction No Bid Submitted
P.O. Box 3423 5
Pismo Beach, CA 93448 

T:  805/788-0855    FAX: 805/788-0955

V. Lopez Jr. & Sons No Bid Submitted
200 E. Fesler, Ste 101 5
Santa Maria, Ca 93454

T:  805/928-1179    FAX: 805/928-8262


