Bid Summary

Hatlen Theater - Lighting, Sound, Comm/Data Upgrade
FM100111S/981710

Estimated Construction Cost: $725,000.00
Bid Opening Date: Wednesday, June 2, 2010 @ 2:30PM
Univ. Rep: G. Levinthal

BASE BID

COMPENSABLE DELAY

ALTERNATES

TOTAL PROJECT COST

General Contractor

Base Bid

Compensable Delay

Days

Total
Compensable

Alternate #1

Alternate #2 -Post
Award

Base Bid w/unit prices &
Compensable Delays

Base Bid w/unit prices &

Compensable Delays & Alt. 1

Total with all Alternates Qualify/Not Qualify

Brannon Inc., DBA Smith Electric Service

$625,162.00

$625,162.00

$598,390.00

$608,475.00 Not Qualified

1340 W. Betteravia Road

$0.00

10

$0.00

Deduct

Add

Bid Rejected

Santa Maria, CA 93455

-$26,772.00

$10,085.00

T: 805/621-5000 FAX: 805/621-5050

Subcontractors

Electrical: Emerson Network Power Energy System

ETC Electrical Dimming System: PRG

Circle 'C' Electric Service, Inc.

$638,885.00

Deduct

Add

$639,885.00

$607,085.00

$654,085.00

7230 Carmel Valley Rd.,

$100.00

10

$1,000.00

-$32,800.00

$47,000.00

Carmel, CA 93923

T:831/372-1875 FAX: 831/626-4063

Subcontractors

L.V. Control/Ter./Minor Rigging: Musson Theatrical, Inc.

Alternates 1 & 2

Communication/Data: Johnson Electronics

CP Systems

No Bid Submitted

16016 Sierra Hwy

10

Canyon County, CA 91390

T: 661/250-9191 FAX: 661/250-9330

HP Communications, Inc.

No Bid Submitted

5720 Thornwood Dr.

10

Goleta, CA 93117

T:915/471-1919  FAX: 805/683-4326
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LVH Entertainment Systems

$710,462.00

Deduct

Add

$711,462.00

$686,504.00

$716,322.00

300 Irving Drive

$100.00

10 $1,000.00

-$24,958.00

$29,818.00

Oxnard, CA 93030

T: 805/278-4587 FAX: 805/278-7709

Subcontractors

Elevator: Kone Inc.

Musson Theatrical

No Bid Submitted

890 Walsh Avenue

10

Santa Clara, CA 95050

T: 408/986-0210 FAX: 408/986-9552

MPA Lighting Inc.

No Bid Submitted

6640 Sunset Blvd., Ste 100

10

Hollywood, CA 90020

T: 323/461-7285 FAX: 323/461-7286

Quintron

No Bid Submitted

2105 South Blosser Road

10

Santa Maria, CA 93458

T:805/928-4343  FAX: 805/928-5775

Taft Electric Company

$566,831.00

Deduct

Add

$566,831.00

$539,591.00

$560,253.00

Not Qualified

650 Alamo Pintado Road, , 201

$0.00

10 $0.00

-$27,240.00

$20,662.00

Bid Rejected

Solvang, CA 93463

T:805/642-0121  FAX: 805/650-9015

Subcontractors

Abatement: Asbestos Control Testin Inc.

Stage Controls (Lift): Kone Inc.
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