
North Hall Data Center
FM090222L/981610

Estimated Construction Cost: $4,000,000.00
Bid Opening Date: Thursday, May 18, 2010 @ 2:30PM

Univ. Rep: T. Foster

TOTAL PROJECT COST

 General Contractor Base Bid Compensable Delay Days
Total 
Compensable Base Bid w/unit prices & Compensable Delays

Alpha Mechanical Heating & Air Conditioning Inc. $3,882,000.00 $3,882,000.00
4885 Greencraig Lane $0.00 15 $0.00
San Diego, CA 92123

T:  858/278-3500    FAX: 858/278-3510
Subcontractors

Arch/Structural:  PVW Construction.   Electrical:  Oilfield Electric Company DBA Integrity Electric. 
Insulation: Preferred Insulation Contractors Inc.   T&B:  Yardley-Zaretsky Inc.

AMG & Associates, Inc. $3,957,000.00 $3,979,500.00
26470 Reuther Ave. $1,500.00 15 $22,500.00
Santa Clarita, CA 91350

T:   661/251-7401   FAX: 661/251-7404
Subcontractors

Demollition: MCL Construction       Site Utilities:  Toro Enterprises Inc.     Portland Cement Concrete Pavement/Concrete Reinforcement/Cast-in-Place: MCL Construction
Concrete Masonry Units: Glasspoole Masonry Inc.    Structrual Steel, Metal Fabrications:  Craftsmen Construction & Erectors Corp.  Arch. Woodwork: California Woodworking Inc.
Clay Roof Tiles: Derrick's Roofing Inc.   Doors, Frames, & Hardware: Precision Companies Inc.,dba Prescision Doors & Millwork Co.   Aluminum-Framed Storefronts:   Wolf C G S Inc.
Gypsum Board: Premier Drywall    Flooring: Floor Connection Inc.   Access Flooring:  Task Interiors Inc.      Painting:  Ray-Mac Painting Inc.  
Fire Protection Systems:  CA Cnetral Fire Protection Inc.   Plumbing/HVAC Dryside/HVAC Setside:  Tower Air Inc.   Electrical/Fire Alrm Systems:  Taft Electric Company

Better Builders Construction Inc. No Bid Submitted
1025 Palo Verde Ave, #33 15
Long Beach, CA 90815

T: 800/819-4427    FAX: 

Blum & Sons No Bid Submitted
606 Linden Ave 15
Carpinteria, CA 93013

T:  805/684-1010    FAX: 805/684-2260

BASE BID COMPENSABLE DELAY
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Bon Air Inc. No Bid Submitted
11340 Olympic Blvd, #302 15
Los Angeles, CA 90064

T: 310/575-1111      FAX: 310/479-0029

Brannon Inc., DBA Smith Electric Service $4,072,000.00 $4,072,000.00
1340 W. Betteravia Road $0.00 15 $0.00
Santa Maria, CA 93455

T: 805/621-5000     FAX: 805/621-5050
Subcontractors

Demo: Matrix Environmental Inc.   Site Utilities: Tierra Contracting   Masonry: Glasspoole Masonry   Insulation: Karcher Interior Systems Inc.  Roofing: Channel Island Roofing
Glazing/Storefront:  So. Coast Industries Inc., DBA Santa Barbara Glass Company   Flooring: Floor Connection Inc.  Painting: Guy Smithson Painting & Decorating
Raised Floor: Pugliese Interior Systems Inc.  Fire Protection: CA Central Fire Protection Inc.  Controls: Johnson Controls Inc.  
Fire Alarm: SimiplexGrinnell   Elec. Testing: Emerson   Air Balance: Hartmanaire   Metal Stud/Drywall: Pre-Con Industries  
Metal Fabrication: Goleta Fabrication Inc., DBA Precision Welding 

California Central Fire Protection Inc. No Bid Submitted
358 Apache Trail 15
Arroyo Grande, CA 93420

T: 805/481-1331     FAX: 805/481-3466

Cannon Constructors Southen CA, Inc No Bid Submitted
17000 Ventura Blvd, Ste 301 15
Encino, CA 91316

T: 818/906-6200     FAX: 818/906-6220

CWS Systems, Inc. $4,134,000.00 $4,145,250.00
3814 E. Colorado Blvd, #102 $750.00 15 $11,250.00
Pasadena, CA 91107

T:  626/792-1155    FAX: 626/792-1177
Subcontractors

Demo/Grading:  Harfield Construction Corp.  Underground Utilities:  A Q Backhoe Services Inc.   Electrical:  Ali Abdelghani    FireSprinklers:  SW Fire Protection Company
Fire Alarm/Controls:  Tyco Fire    Carpentry-Finish/Concrete:  Rocco Enterprises   Signs:  M&H Signs Inc.   Precasts:  Catalina Structures
Cabinets:  Advanced Woodwork Inc.
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Dahl Air Conditioning Inc. No Bid Submitted
30 S. La Patera Lane Ste 9 15
Goleta, CA 93117

T:  805/964-2002   FAX: 805/683-7654

Doug Alan Development No Bid Submitted
1570 Raspberry Street 15
Arroyo Grande, CA 93420

T: 805/440-9444     FAX: 805/481-3466

Environmental Heating and A/C No Bid Submitted
821 N. Maulhardt Avenue 15
Oxnard, CA 93030

T:  805/278-4425    FAX: 805/278-4420

Frank Schipper Construction No Bid Submitted
610 E. Cota Street, 15
Santa Barbara, CA 93101

T:  805/963-4359    FAX: 805/963-1270

G2K Construction Inc. $4,731,576.00 $4,740,576.00
28348 Road Side Dr., #205 $600.00 15 $9,000.00
Agoura Hills, CA 91301

T: 818/889-6046     FAX: 818/889-6048
Subcontractors

Electrical:  Stuart Klein DBA Westside Electric   HVAC: Alliance Mechanical Group   Plumbing/Fire Protection: NST Plumbing & Fire Protection Inc.
Site Demolition/Concrete, Masonry, Portland Cement Plaster, Framing:  Persa Construction   Insulation: MD Insulation Company   Roofing: Westway Construction Inc. 
Flooring:  Truewest- Carpet    Painting:  Vanguard Painting Inc.  Metals:  Craftsmen Constructin & Erectors Corp.  Hazardous Meterials: Karcher Environmental Inc.
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Kinyon Construction $4,025,676.00 $4,025,676.00
4591 Merridock Court $0.00 15 $0.00
Santa Maria, CA 93455

T:  805/938-7990    FAX: 805/934-9500
Subcontractors

Painting/Drywall/Stud: Senel Construction Engineering   Survey & Staking: Penfield & Smith   Masonry:  Calvin W. Craig   Roofing: Channel Islands Roofing Inc.
Concrete Demo: Schwan Brothers Excavating Contractors Inc.   Steel Fabrication: Goleta Fabrication Inc., DBA Precision Welding   Plumbing/HVAC-Wet: M/M Mechanical Inc.
Electrical/Communications/Fire Alarm: Taft Electric Company   HVAC - Dry: Tower Air Inc.   Raised Access Flooring: Pugliese Interior Systems Inc. 
Store Front Glass: So. Coast Industries Inc., DBA Santa Barbara Glass Company    Doors & Hardware: ABBA Distributors Inc., DBA Design Hardware Company
Rubber Floors: Floor Connection Inc.   Fire Sprinklers: CA Central Fire Protection Inc.  Conrete/Interior Demo/Specialty Items/Plaster/Unistrut: RK& G Construction 
Acoustical Ceiling: Pacific Acoustics North Inc.    Firestopping: Karcher Interior Systems Inc.   Cabinets:  California Woodworking Inc.   Underground Utilities: Mainline Underground Const. Inc.

Lash Construction Inc. No Bid Submitted
721 Carpinteria Ave 15
Santa Barbara, CA 93103

T: 805/963-3553     FAX: 805/965-8134

Los Angeles Air Conditioning No Bid Submitted
1714 Lindbergh Court 15
La Verne, CA 91750

T: 909/596-7077    FAX: 909/596-6657

Melchiori Construction $3,890,688.00 $3,890,688.00
809 De La Vina Street $0.00 15 $0.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93105

T:   805/962-9505   FAX: 805/962-8776
Subcontractors

Demolition:  Independent Concrete Cutting Inc.   Site Utilities:  Mainline Underground Construction Inc.   Concrete:  John Kenney Construction Inc., DBA Kenney Construction
Masonry: Peralez Masonry   Metal Fabrication/Unistrut:  Craftsmen Construction & Erectors Corp.   Solid Surfacing:  GW  Surfaces   Bldg Insulation:  No. County Insulation Inc.
Composite Wall Panels: Merit Metal Products Inc.  Aluminum Storefronts/Glazing: So. Coast Industries Inc., DBA Santa Barbara Glass Company
Lath & Plaster/Metal Framing/Gypsum Board:  Tarlton & Son Inc.  Rubber Floor & Resilient Base:  Floor Connection Inc.   
Painting & Coatings: Guy Smithson Painting & Decorating   Access Flooring:  Pugliese Interior Systems Inc.  Plumbing:  Koehler Plumbing Inc. 
Fire Sprinklers: CA Central Fire Protection Inc.  HVAC: Environmental Heating & Air Conditioning Inc.  Electrical/Generator/Fire Alarm: Berelectric Corp.

MTM Construction Inc. No Bid Submitted
16035 Phonix Dr 15
City of Industries, CA 91745

T:  626/934-1112    FAX: 626/934-1113



North Hall Data Center
FM090222L/981610

Estimated Construction Cost: $4,000,000.00
Bid Opening Date: Thursday, May 18, 2010 @ 2:30PM

Univ. Rep: T. Foster

TOTAL PROJECT COST

 General Contractor Base Bid Compensable Delay Days
Total 
Compensable Base Bid w/unit prices & Compensable Delays

BASE BID COMPENSABLE DELAY

Newton Construction Management $3,374,000.00 $3,378,500.00
4573 Spanish Oaks Drive $300.00 15 $4,500.00

San Luis Obispo, CA 93401

T:  805/544-5583    FAX: 805/544-5584
Subcontractors

Grading:  Schwan Brothers Excavating Contractors Inc.   Site Utilities: Dave Spurr Excavating Inc.   Masonry: Calvin W. Graig   Steel: Goleta Fabrication Inc., DBA Precision Welding
Glazing: So. Coast Industries Inc., DBA Santa Barbara Glass Company   Painting:  Guy Smithson Painting & Decorating Inc.  
Access Flooring: Pugliese Interior Systems Inc.  Drywall: Senel Construction Engineering   Fire Protection: CA Central Fire Protection Inc.  
HVAC: Alp;ha Plumbing & Mechanical Inc.   Electrical: Oilfield Electric Company, DBA Integrity Electric

Pavilion Construction, LLC. No Bid Submitted
6720 S.W. Macadam Ave. Suite 310 15
Portland, OR 97219

T:  503-290-5005    FAX: 503-244-1810

Royal Window Films, Inc. No Bid Submitted
1159 N. Patt St. 15
Anaheim, CA 92801

T: 714/618-8477     FAX: 714/992-5083

SBS Corporation $3,965,723.00 $3,973,223.00
31416 Agoura Road, ,#135 $500.00 15 $7,500.00
Westlake Village, CA 91361

T:  818/597-4363    FAX: 818/597-4368
Subcontractors

Demolition/Abatement: Independent Concrete Cutting Inc.   Concrete: John Kenney Construction Inc., DBA Kenney Construction   Fire Alarms: SimplexGrinnell
Glazing & Storefronts: So. Coast Industries Inc., DBA Santa Barbara Glass Company   Grading: Schwan Brothers Excavating Contractors Inc.  
Underground Utilities: Tierra Contracting  Fire Sprinklers:  N&D Fire Protection Inc.  Roofing: Craig Roof Company Inc.  Access Flooring: Pugliese Interior Systems Inc.
Metals-Steel: Craftsmen Construction & Erectors Corp.  Drywall-Metal Stud/Framing: Senel Construction Engineering   Plumbing/HVAC: M/M Mechanical Inc.
Mechanical: Tower Air Inc.   Electrical: Taft Electric Company   Masonry: Glasspoole Masonry Inc.  Casework: DHK Solutions Inc. 

Seaside Electric No Bid Submitted
1995 E. Main Street 15
Ventura, CA 93001

T: 805/656-1100    FAX:  805/641-3451

SimplexGrinnell No Bid Submitted
900 Allen Ave 15
Glendale, CA 91201

T:   818/247-1199   FAX: 818/247-0999

Specialty Construction Inc. No Bid Submitted
645 Clarion Ct. 15
San Luis Obispo, CA 93401

T: 805/543-1706     FAX: 805/543-1722

Taft Electric Company No Bid Submitted
1694 Eastman Ave 15

Ventura, CA 93006
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T:  805/642-0121    FAX: 805/642-0125
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Tower Air Inc. No Bid Submitted
867 S. Kellogg "B" 15
Goleta, CA 93117

T:  805/681-0059   FAX: 805/681-0069

Viola Construction Co. $3,659,000.00 $3,659,000.00
1144 Commercial Avenue $0.00 15 $0.00
Oxnard, CA 93031

T:   805/487-3871   FAX: 805/487-3870
Subcontractors

Demo/Removal&Patching: Independent Concrete Cutting Inc.   Earthwork: Schwan Brothers Excavating Contractors Inc.  Underground Utilities/Site Conrete: Toro Enterprises Inc.
Cast in Place Concrete: John Kenney Construction Inc. DBA Kenney Construction   Masonry: Glasspoole Masonry Inc.   
Misc. Carpentry - M&T/Rough Carpentry M&T (plywood)/Steel Doors, Frames & Harware: M & T Concrete Inc.  Architectural Millwork: DHK Solutions Inc.  
Bldg Insulation: Masco Contractor Services of CA Inc.  Aluminum Framed Storefronts/Glass & Glazing: So. Coast Industries Inc., DBA Santa Barbara Glass Company   
Metal Stud Framing & Drywall: AGS Wall Systems Inc.  Painting & Coastings/High Performance Coatings:  Guy Smithson Painting & Decorating Inc.  
Access Flooring: Pugliese Interior Systems Inc.   Fire Protection: CA Central Fire Protection Inc.    Plumbing:  M/M Mechanical Inc.   
HVAC/WetHVAC Environmental Heating & Air Conditioning Inc.  HVAC Controls (BMCS)-Allowance: Johnson Controls Inc.  
Electrical, Comm & FA/Air Smapling Smoke Detection System/Leak Detection System:  Oilfield Electric Company, DBA Integrity Electric
Struct. Steel/Metal Fabrication/Unistrut: Craftsmen Construction & Erectors Corp.

Vision Communications No Bid Submitted
1421 State Street, "F" 15
Santa Barbara, CA 93101

T: 805/963-7676     FAX: 805/963-7673
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