
 Bid Summary
Lab Remodel Rm 1171 H2 Generator

FM100279S/987744

Estimated Construction Cost: $260,000.00
Bid Opening Date: Thursday, July 8, 2010 @ 2:30PM

TOTAL PROJECT COST

 General Contractor Base Bid Compensable Delay Days
Total 
Compensable Base Bid  & Compensable Delays

Anderson Systems $328,367.00 $328,367.00
5958 Corta Street $0.00 5 $0.00
Goleta, CA 93117

T: 805/683-6133     FAX: 805/964-2357
Subcontractors

Concrete/Rough Carpentry: Channel Island Constrution      Painting:  D&D Painting
Electrical:  Imperial Electric Co.    Controls: Johnson Controls Inc.
Wet Sprinkler: Nargan Fire & Safety Co. Inc.

Brannon Inc., DBA Smith Electric Service No Bid Submitted
1430 W. Betteravia Road 5
Santa Barbara,  CA 93455

T:  805/621-5000    FAX: 805/621-5050

Danae Engineering No Bid Submitted
P.O. Box 3442 5
Ventura, CA 93003

T: 805/774-8587    FAX: 805/650-8618
Subcontractors

DWG & Associates Inc. $278,000.00 $280,500.00
320 E. Walnut Ave. $500.00 5 $2,500.00
Lompoc, CA 93436

T:  805/736-8878    FAX: 805/736-8883
Subcontractors

Mechanical: Johnson Controls Inc.

BASE BID COMPENSABLE DELAY
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EJS Construction $423,000.00 $423,000.00
4191 Carpinteria Ave., Suite 7 $0.00 5 $0.00
Carpinteria, CA 93013

T:    805/684-6381  FAX: 805/684-6446
Subcontractors

Sheet Metal Roof: Merit Metal Products Inc.  Paint:  Guy Smithson Painting & Decorating Inc.
Plaster: McPherson Plastering Inc.   HVAC:  Dahl Air Conditioning Inc.   Controls: Johnson Controls Inc.
Fire Sprinklers: Joy Equipment Protection Inc.   Electrical:  RA Electric    Plumbing: M/M Mechanical

Goleta Plumbing & Mechanical No Bid Submitted
90 Santa Felicia Dr. 5
Goleta, CA 93111

T:  805/967-3502    FAX: 805/685-9192
Subcontractors

Imperial Electric No Bid Submitted
6445 Calle Real 5
Goleta, CA 63117

T: 805/681-0676     FAX: 805/681-0703
Subcontractors

Kinyon Construction Inc. $556,729.00 $556,729.00
4591 Merridock Ct. $0.00 5 $0.00
Santa Maria, CA 93455

T: 805/938-7990     FAX: 805/934-9500
Subcontractors

Acoustic, Concrete, Doors:  RK&G Construction   Metal Stud, Plastering: Cassidy's United Construction  Electrical: Blum & Sons Electric Inc.
Controls: Johnson Controls Inc.  Fabrications: Windansea Welding   Mechanical/Plumbing; M/M Mechanical Inc.
Painting: Guy Smithson Painting & Decoration Inc.   HVAC: Top Notch Heating Inc.  Demo: Schwan Brothers Excavating Contractors Inc.  
Fire Sprinklers:  Donald R. Spoor Inc.
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Newton Construction $403,000.00 $404,000.00
P.O. Box 3260 $200.00 5 $1,000.00
San Luis Obispo, CA 93403

T:  805/544-5583    FAX: 805/544-5584
Subcontractors

Plumbing/HVAC: Alpha Plumbing & Mechanical Inc.
Fire Protection: CA Central Fire Protection Inc.   Painting: Mar Vista Painting 
Metal Roofing: Merit Metal Products Inc.   HVAC Controls: Johnson Controls Inc.

SBS Corporation No Bid Submitted
31416 Agoura Rd., #135 5
Westlake Village, CA 91361

T: 818/597-4363     FAX: 818/597-4363
Subcontractors

Taft Electric No Bid Submitted
650 Alamo Pintado Road, Ste 201 5
Solvang, CA 93463

T:  805/688-0121    FAX: 805/688-0125
Subcontractors

Tasco Construction No Bid Submitted 
2802 N. Ventura Ave, Suite A 5
Ventura, CA 93001

T: 805/987-1824     FAX: 805/648-2235
Subcontractors
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Tomar Construction No Bid Submitted 
5304 Elmhurst Street. 5
Ventura, CA 93003

T: 805/642-8816     FAX: 805/642-8813
Subcontractors
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