
Harder Stadium Scoreboard Re-Bid
Project No. FM100360SR/987755

Estimated Construction Cost: $293,350.00
University Representative: Deedee Ciancola

TOTAL PROJECT COST

 General Contractor Base Bid Unit Price
Unit 
Quantity Description

Total Unit 
Price

Compensable 
Delay Days

Total 
Compensable

Base Bid w/unit 
prices & 
Compensable 
Delays Total

Bottonfield Construction
24832 Apple St $389,222.00 $235.00 1 Linear Feet $235.00 $0.00 20 $0.00 $389,562.00 $389,562.00
Newhall, CA 91321 $105.00 1 Linear Feet $105.00
T:   661/260-1720   FAX: 661/260-1401

Subcontractors High Perfomrance Coatings - Guy Smithson
Electrical - Good Service Electric Structural Steel - Bill's Welding $340.00
Sports Field Equipment - Fair-Play Drilling/Caissons - Curtis Cosntruction 

Brannon Inc., DBA Smith Electric Service
1340 W. Betteravia Rd 1 Linear Feet $0.00 20 $0.00
Santa Maria, CA 93455 NO BID SUBMITTED 1 Linear Feet $0.00
T:   805/621-5000   FAX:  805/621-5050

Subcontractors

Coastal Electric
1312 S. Rice Road 1 Linear Feet 20
Ojai, CA 93023 NO BID SUBMITTED 1 Linear Feet
T: 805/798-0790    FAX:  805/640-9173

Submcontractors

Cysturion
950 E. 84th Street 1 Linear Feet $0.00 20 $0.00
Indianapolis, IN 46240 NO BID SUBMITTED 1 Linear Feet $0.00
T:  800/428-4014   FAX:  601/428-1948

Subcontractors

D3
519 Broad Street Suite 202 1 Linear Feet 20
Rome, GA 30161 NO BID SUBMITTED 1 Linear Feet
T: 818/312-4544    FAX:  706/378-3327

Subcontractors
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D3/All American
2043 Sunrise Circle 1 Linear Feet $0.00 20 $0.00 $0.00
Rancho Cordova, CA NO BID SUBMITTED 1 Linear Feet $0.00
T:   916/548-8120   FAX: $0.00

Subcontractors

Daktronics
331 32nd Avenue 1 Linear Feet $0.00 20 $0.00 $0.00
Brookings, SD 57006 NO BID SUBMITTED 1 Linear Feet $0.00
T:   605/697-4052   FAX:  605/697-4700 $0.00

Subcontractors

EJS Construction Inc.
4191 #7 Carpinteria Ave 1 Linear Feet $0.00 20 $0.00 $0.00
Carpinteria, CA 93013 NO BID SUBMITTED 1 Linear Feet $0.00
T:  805/684-6381     FAX:  805/684-6312 $0.00

Subcontractors

Fair-Play Scoreboards
3251 Corte Malpaso, #503 1 Linear Feet $0.00 20
Camarillo, CA 93012 NO BID SUBMITTED 1 Linear Feet $0.00
T:  805/484-2889   FAX:  805/484-5020

Subcontractors

Fluoresco Lighting - Sign Maintenance Corp.
2778 Pomona Blvd. $386,512.00 $420.00 1 Linear Feet $420.00 $2,900.00 20 $58,000.00 $444,932.00 $444,932.00
Pomona, CA 91768 $0.00 1 Linear Feet $0.00
T:  909/592-0870    FAX:  909/592-0493 $420.00

Subcontractors
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John Worrison Inc.
5333 College Ave, #240 1 Linear Feet $0.00 20 $0.00 $0.00
Oakland, CA  94618 NO BID SUBMITTED 1 Linear Feet $0.00
T:  510/633-5404    FAX:  510/633-5414 $0.00

Subcontractors

Kinyon Construction Inc.
4591 Merridock Court $413,716.00 $215.00 1 Linear Feet $215.00 $0.00 20 $0.00 $413,978.25 $413,978.25
Santa Maria, CA 93455 $47.25 1 Linear Feet $47.25
T:   805/938-7990   FAX:  805/934-9500 $262.25

Subcontractors Drilling/Caissons - R Myers Inc. 
Electrical/Comm/Trench - Good Service Electric Painting - California Pro Painting Inc.
Concrete/Asphalt Patch - RK&G Construction Scoreboard - Trans-Lux Midwest Corp., dba Fair-Play

Newton Construction & Management Inc.
259 Higueva                                         PO Box 3260 $470,000.00 $200.00 1 Linear Feet $200.00 $120.00 20 $2,400.00 $472,950.00 $472,950.00
San Luis Obispo, CA 93401           SLO, 93403 $350.00 1 Linear Feet $350.00
T:     805/544-5583  FAX:   805/544-5584 $550.00

Subcontractors Scoreboards- Fairplay
Steel- Precision Welding Caissons- Elliott Drilling
Painting- Guy Smithson

P.S. Services Inc.
2820 E. Gretta Lane 1 Linear Feet $0.00 20 $0.00 $0.00
Anaheim, CA 92806 NO BID SUBMITTED 1 Linear Feet $0.00
T:  714/683-1120    FAX:  714/683-1140 $0.00

Subcontractors

Precision Welding
5790 Thornwood Suite B 1 Linear Feet $0.00 20 $0.00 $0.00
Goleta, CA 93117 NO BID SUBMITTED 1 Linear Feet $0.00
T: 805/683-1848     FAX:  805/964-6653 $0.00

Subcontractors
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Sage Electric
P.O. Box 5606 1 Linear Feet $0.00 20 $0.00 $0.00
Santa Maria, CA 93456 NO BID SUBMITTED 1 Linear Feet $0.00
T:   805/922-1953   FAX:  805/349-9353 $0.00

Subcontractors

SBS Corporation
3451 Westlake Village 1 Linear Feet $0.00 20 $0.00 $0.00
Westlake, CA 92701 NO BID SUBMITTED 1 Linear Feet $0.00
T:  818/577-4363    FAX:  818/597-4368 $0.00

Subcontractors

Sign and Lighting Services
2160 Audubon Way 1 Linear Feet $0.00 20 $0.00 $0.00
Lake Forest,  CA 92630 NO BID SUBMITTED 1 Linear Feet $0.00
T: 949/716-5620     FAX:  949/716-5620 $0.00

Subcontractors

Trans-LMX Fair-Play Scoreboards
3251 Corte Malpaso Suite 503 1 Linear Feet $0.00 20 $0.00 $0.00
Camarillo, CA 93012 NO BID SUBMITTED 1 Linear Feet $0.00
T:  800/204-0402    FAX:  805/484-5020 $0.00

Subcontractors

Vision Communications
1421 State St. Suite F 1 Linear Feet $0.00 20 $0.00 $0.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93101 NO BID SUBMITTED 1 Linear Feet $0.00
T:   805/690-4430   FAX:  805/963-7673 $0.00

Subcontractors
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