
Bid Summary
Carrillo Commons Kitchen Addition

FM050493S/987646
Estimated Construction Costs: $140,000.00

Project Manager: K. Burrelsman
Bid Opening Date: Tuesday, December 13, 2005 @ 2:30PM

Contractor Base Bid Compensable Delay Days Total Compensable
Base Bid Plus 

Compensable Delays Total
Brannon DBA Smith Electric Service $154,744.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $154,754.00 $154,754.00
2335 Meredith Lane
Santa Maria, CA 93455
805/922-6243/ Fax 805/922-9770

Subcontractors: 
Roofing: Channel Island Roofing
Painting: Ray-Mac Painting
Air Balance: LA Air Balance
Controls: Breen Automation

Carroll Construction $144,000.00 $200.00 10 $2,000.00 $146,000.00 $146,000.00
216 E. Guiterrez
Santa Barbara, CA 93101
805/966-4810/ Fax 805/969-5654

Subcontractors: 
HVAC: Dahl Air Conditioning
Plumbing: Kittle Plumbing
Electric:  Goleta Electric

Cornego Construction No Bid Submitted 10
809 E. Carrillo Street
Santa Barbara, CA 93101
805/965-6404/ Fax 805/965-7644

Dahl Air Conditioning No Bid Submitted 10
30 S. La Patera Lane, Ste 9
Goleta, CA 93117
805/964-2002/ Fax 805/683-7654

EJS Construction No Bid Submitted 10
4191 Carpinteria Ave, Suite 7
Carpinteria, CA 93013
805/684-6381/ Fax 805/684-6312

Kamran & Co. $140,000.00 $900.00 10 $9,000.00 $149,000.00 $149,000.00
411 E., Montecito Street
Santa Barbara, CA 93101
805/896-7772/ Fax 805962-5915

Subcontractors: 
Plumbing: Kittle Plumbing
Electrical: Goleta Electric
Sheet Metal: CMI Installations

Newton Construction Management No Bid Submitted 10
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4573 Spanish Oaks Drive
San Luis Obispo, CA 93401
805/544-5583/ Fax 805/544-5584

Schock Contracting No Bid Submitted 10
340 S. Kellogg, Suite J
Goleta, CA 93117
805/681-9796/ Fax 805/681-9717

Wagner & Holmes No Bid Submitted 10
P.O. Box 206
Santa Paula, CA 93060
805/525-5217/ Fax 805/525-1617


