
Harder Stadium Curtice Gate
Project No.:  FM100397S/077-57

Estimated Construction Cost: $84,700.00
University Representative: Deedee Ciancola

ALTERNATES

 General Contractor Base Bid
Compensable 
Delay Days

Total 
Compensable Alternate #1 Alternate #2

Base Bid & 
Compensable 
Delays Total Alternates 

Total with all 
Alternates

Cornejo Construction
809 E. Carrillo Street 20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93101 No Bid Submitted
T:   805/965-6404   FAX:  805/965-7644

Subcontractors

Granite Construction Company
5111 Debbie Lane 20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93111 No Bid Submitted
T:   805/964-9951   FAX:  805/964-7661

Subcontractors

Hanly General Engineering Corp.
3191 Mission Drive 20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Santa Ynez, Ca 93460 No Bid Submitted
T:   805/688-3752  FAX:  805/688-7138

Subcontractors

Judson Builders
3911 N. Ventura Avenue 20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Ventura, CA 93003 No Bid Submitted
T:   805/844-0503   FAX:  805/643-9046

Subcontractors

Kinyon Construction
4591 Merridock Court 20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Santa Maria, CA 93455 No Bid Submitted
T:  805/938-7990    FAX:  805/934-9500

Subcontractors
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Lash Construction, Inc.
721 Carpinteria St. 20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93103 No Bid Submitted
T:  805/963-3553    FAX: 805/965-8189

Subcontractors

Newton Construction 
259 Higuera Street 20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
San Luis Obispo, CA 93401 No Bid Submitted
T:   805/544-5583   FAX:  805/544-5584

Subcontractors

Schmidt & Schmidt Construction
103 N. Nopal St. 20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93103 No Bid Submitted
T:  805/884-4903    FAX:  805/884-4911

Subcontractors

Seguro Corporation
820 State Street 4th Floor $121,554.54 $500.00 20 $10,000.00 $14,272.50 $9,857.50 $131,554.54 $24,130.00 $155,684.54
Santa Barbara, CA 93101
T:   805/564-7800   FAX:  805/564-7809

Subcontractors Atlernate #1 Subcontractor:  Landscape- David Frantz Landscapes, Inc.
Iron- Rincon Iron Works Atlernate #2 Subcontractor: Landscape -  David Frantz Landscapes, Inc.
Landscape - David Frantz Landscapes, Inc.
Electric - Proficient Electric

Bid Open: 2:30PM, Thursday, August 12, 2010


