
Project:  Harder Stadium Concessions
Project No.:  FM100396S/077-60
University Representative: Deedee Ciancola

Estimated Construction Cost: $173,063.00

ALTERNATES

 General Contractor Base Bid Unit Price
Unit 
Quantity Description

Total Unit 
Price

Compensable 
Delay Days

Total 
Compensable Alternate #1 Alternate #2 Alternate #3

Base Bid w/unit 
prices & 
Compensable 
Delays Total Alternates Total with all Alternates

Blois Construction, Inc.
3201 Stugis Road 20 Lineal Feet $0.00 20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Oxnard, CA  93030 NO BID RECEIVED 20 Lineal Feet $0.00
T:  805/656-1432    FAX:  805/485-0338

Subcontractors

Brannon Inc dba Smith Electric
1340 W. Betteravia $200,020.00 $80.00 20 Lineal Feet $1,600.00 $0.00 20 $0.00 $129,882.00 $39,407.00 $22,420.00 $203,620.00 $191,709.00 $395,329.00
Santa Maria, CA 93455 $100.00 20 Lineal Feet $2,000.00
T:   805/621-5000   FAX:  805/621-5050 $3,600.00

Subcontractors Landscape- JD Humann
Grading/Demo- MJ Ross Alt. #1 Structure - Tension Structures
Utilities/Paving - MJ Ross Alt. #1 Cassens- Case Pacific
Fencing - Fence Factory

Coastal Construction
3144 Via Real 20 Lineal Feet $0.00 20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Carpinteria, CA 93013 NO BID RECEIVED 20 Lineal Feet $0.00
T:  805/684-5890   FAX:   805/684-5969

Subcontractors

Eide Industries, Inc, Tension Structures
16215 Piuma Ave 20 Lineal Feet $0.00 20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Cerritos, CA  90703 NO BID RECEIVED 20 Lineal Feet $0.00
T:   562-402-8335   FAX:  562/924-2233

Subcontractors

EJS Construction
4191 Carpinteria Ave. #7             PO Box 939 $227,000.00 $100.00 20 Lineal Feet $2,000.00 $0.00 20 $0.00 $170,000.00 $72,000.00 $43,300.00 $231,500.00 $285,300.00 $516,800.00
Carpinteria, CA  93013 $125.00 20 Lineal Feet $2,500.00
T:   805/684-6381   FAX:  805/684-6446 $4,500.00

Subcontractors Electrical- R/A Electric Helical Piers- Foundation Solutions
Grading- Coastal Construction Structural Steel- Tension Structures Concrete Piles- Case Pacific
Paving- Toste Grading/Paving Landscape- Coastal Landscape
Plumbing- Coastal Construction Fencing- Fence Factory
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Hanly General Engineering 
3191 Mission Drive $222,000.00 $250.00 20 Lineal Feet $5,000.00 $0.00 20 $0.00 $152,000.00 $42,680.00 $28,880.00 $228,000.00 $223,560.00 $451,560.00
Santa Ynez, CA  93460 $50.00 20 Lineal Feet $1,000.00
T:   805/688-3752   FAX:  805/688-7138 $6,000.00

Subcontractors Electric- JPL
Chainlink Fence- Fence Factory Alt. #1 Tension Structure- Tension Structures Alt. #1 Screw Anchors- Foundation Solutions
Asphalt Paving- Ramsey Alt. #1 Drilling/Piers- Terra Firma
Steel Fabrication- Hank Welding Alt. #1- Steel Reinforcement- Benkat Steel

Judson Builders
3911 N. Ventura Avenue 20 Lineal Feet $0.00 $0.00 20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Ventura, CA  93003 NO BID RECEIVED 20 Lineal Feet $0.00
T:  805/643-9306    FAX:  805/643-9046

Subcontractors

Kinyon Construction
4591 Merridock Court $262,458.02 $92.00 20 Lineal Feet $1,840.00 $0.00 20 $0.00 $167,319.00 $51,714.00 $22,592.00 $266,598.02 $241,625.00 $508,223.02
Santa Maria, CA 93455 $115.00 20 Lineal Feet $2,300.00
T:   805/938-7990   FAX:   805/934-9500 $4,140.00 Alt.#1 Helical Piers- Foundation Solutions Alt.#3 Earthwork/paving/underground Elec-MJ Ross

Subcontractors Underground Electric - MJ Ross Rebar- Vista Steel Alt. #2 Electrical- Mark Schwind Electric Alt.#3 Underground Plumb.&Mech.- MM Mechanical 
Concrete form work/Foundation - RK&G Construction Earthwork- MJ Ross LPG enclosure- C&W Construction Specialities Alt. #2 Demo/earthwork/paving/underground elec.- MJ Ross
Electrical - Mark Schwind Paving/saw cut/demo- MJ Ross Alt.#1 Shade Structure- Eide Insustries Inc. Alt. #2 Underground plumbing, mechanical- MM Mechanical
Plumbing/mechanical Underground - MM Mechanical Fencing- Central Coast Fencing Alt. #1 Foundation Piers-RK&G Alt. #3 Electric- Mark Schwind Electric

Primo Plumbing/Mechanical
PO Box 1823 20 Lineal Feet $0.00 20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Goleta, CA 93116 NO BID RECEIVED 20 Lineal Feet $0.00
T:   805/717-7787   FAX:  805/863-4935

Subcontractors

SBS Corporation
31416 Agoura Rd. Suite 135 20 Lineal Feet $0.00 20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Westlake Village, CA 91361 NO BID RECEIVED 20 Lineal Feet $0.00
T:    818/597-4363  FAX:  818/597-4368

Subcontractors
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Schmidt & Schmidt Construction, Inc.
103 N. Nopal 20 Lineal Feet $0.00 20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93103 NO BID RECEIVED 20 Lineal Feet $0.00
T:   805/884-4903   FAX:  805/884-4911

Subcontractors

Seguro Corporation
820 State St. 4th Floor $185,895.00 $120.00 20 Lineal Feet $2,400.00 $700.00 20 $14,000.00 $128,000.00 $29,843.00 $43,538.00 $204,895.00 $201,381.00 $406,276.00
Santa Barbara,  CA 93101 $130.00 20 Lineal Feet $2,600.00
T:   805/564-7800   FAX:  805/564-7809 $5,000.00

Subcontractors Chainlink- Fence Factory
Site Utilities- Tierra Contracting Alt. #1 Drilling- Myer's Drilling
Electric- Proficient Electric Alt. #1 Awning- Tension Structures
Paving- United Paving Alt. #1 Helical-Foundation Solutions

Vision Communications
1421 State St. Suite F 20 Lineal Feet $0.00 20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Santa Barbara,  CA 93101 NO BID RECEIVED 20 Lineal Feet $0.00
T:    805/690-4411  FAX:  805/963-7673

Subcontractors
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