Bid Summary

Harder Stadium Press Box Renovation

FM100303S/987754

BASE BID

COMPENSABLE DELAY

TOTAL PROJECT COST

General Contractor Base Bid

Compensable Delay

Days Compensable

Total

Alternate #1

Base Bid + Extended Compensable
Delay+Alternate 1

Brannon Inc., DBA Smith Electric Service $125,016.00
1430 W. Betteravia Road
Santa Barbara, CA 93455

T: 805/621-5000 FAX: 805/621-5050
Subcontractors
Acoustical Ceilings: Pacific Acoustsics North  Carpet: Curtis Carpet, Inc.
Paint: Guy Smithson Painting & Decorating Inc. Abatement & Demo: Channel Coast Corp.
Roofing: Craig Roofing Company Inc.

$0.00

20

$0.00

ADD
$8,000.00

$133,016.00

Concord Construction No Bid Submitted
5547 Yarmouth Ave, #8
Encino, CA 91131

T: 818/922-5223 FAX: 818/627-9006
Subcontractors

20

Cornejo Construciton No Bid Submitted
809 E. Carrillo St reet
Satna Barbara, CA 93101

T: 805/965-6404 FAX: 805/965-7644
Subcontractors

20

EJS Construction $88,800.00
4191 Carpinteria Ave., Suite 7
Carpinteria, CA 93013

T: 805/684-6381 FAX: 805/684-6312

Subcontractors
Roof: Craig Roofing Company Inc.  Flooring: Curtis Carpet Inc Paint: Mar Vista Painting
Ceiling: Pacific Acoustic North Inc Cab. Countertop: Superior Millwork of SB Inc.

$0.00

20

$0.00

Electrical: RA Electric Deck/Coating: SB Surfacing Inc. Data/Communications: Pacific Coast Sound a& Communications Inc., DBA Pacific Communications

Abatement: Channel Coast Corp.

ADD
$8,750.00

$97,550.00

GRL $129,333.00
P.O. Box 2421
Orcut, CA 93457

T: 805/347-7860 FAX: 805/347-1999
Subcontractors
Roofing: Pueblo Construction Inc. Doors/Hardware: The Door Stop  Acoustical Tile: Tikal Acoustics
Carpet: Leslie Aron DBA LACO Floor Covering Company Signage: P.S. Services Inc.
Casework: Dynamic Cabinet Designs Inc. Electrical/Communications: Betary Inc. DBA Sage Elecrtic

$750.00

20

$15,000.00

ADD
$19,907.00

$164,240.00

Estimated Construction Cost: $94,692.00
Bid Opening Date: Tuesday, July 13, 2010 @ 2:30PM
Univ. Rep: D. Ciancola
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Kinyon Construction Inc. $138,901.00
4591 Merridock Ct.
Santa Maria, CA 93455

T: 805/938-7990  FAX: 805/934-9500
Subcontractors
Casework/Cabinet: Superior Millwork of SB Inc. Doors/Framing: RK & G Construction
Acoustic Ceiling: Pacific Acoustics North  Flooring: Cu rtis Capet Inc.
Windows: South Coast Industires DBA Santa Barbara Glass Co Abatement: Channel Coast Corporation

Electrical/Communications: Blum & Sons Electrical Inc. Painting: Guy Smithson Painting & Decorating Inc. Roofing:

ADD
$0.00 20 $0.00 $8,649.00

Craig Roofing Company Inc.

$147,550.00

MACCOR Inc. No Bid Submitted
1956 Paaancho Road
Camarillo, CA 93010

T: 805/585-9001  FAX: 805/384-0593
Subcontractors

20

Patscheck Construction Company No Bid Submitted
P.O. Box 1194
Camarillo, CA 93011

T: 805/383-2298 FAX:805/383-2297
Subcontractors

20

SBS Corporation $102,256.00
31416 Agoura Rd., #135
Westlake Village, CA 91361

T:818/597-4363  FAX: 818/597-4363
Subcontractors
Millwork: Superior Millwork of SB Inc.  Painting: Vanguard Painting Inc .

Glazing: South Coast Industries DBA Santa Barbara Glass Co. Flooring: Leslie Aron DBA LACO Floor Covering Company

Abatement: Channel Coast Corporation Electrical: All Power Systems Roofing Repair: Craig Roofing Company Inc.

Alternate 1 - Roofing: Craig Roofing Company Inc.

ADD
$0.00 20 $0.00 $9,375.00

$111,631.00

Schmidt & Schmidt Construction $94,292.00
103 N. Nopal
Santa Barbara, CA 93103

T: 805/884-4903 FAX: 805/889-4911
Subcontractors
Roofing: Mendez Roofing Inc. Electrical: Art Reed Electric Drywall: Master Drywall
Electrical: Coastal Constructors Inc. Flooring: BPT Flooring Welding: Delta Welding & Fabrication Inc.
Roofing/Moisture Test: Reid Roofing Inc. Painting: Adanac Painting

N/C
$500.00 20 $10,000.00

$0.00

$104,792.00

Estimated Construction Cost: $94,692.00
Bid Opening Date: Tuesday, July 13, 2010 @ 2:30PM
Univ. Rep: D. Ciancola
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SJ Deferville No Bid Submitted
2520 Skyway Dr. 20
Santa Maria, CA 93455
T: 805/9252988 FAX: 805/346-2452
Subcontractors
Tasco Construction No Bid Submitted
2802 N. Ventura Ave, Suite A 20

Ventura, CA 93001

T: 805/987-1824  FAX: 805/648-2235
Subcontractors

Estimated Construction Cost: $94,692.00
Bid Opening Date: Tuesday, July 13, 2010 @ 2:30PM
Univ. Rep: D. Ciancola
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