HSSB Tower Arcade PVC Roof Replacement, HSB Building 515

Estimated Construction Cost: $254,900.00
Bid Opening Date: Friday, September 10, 2010 @ 2:30PM

FM110029S/980835
BASE BID COMPENSABLE DELAY TOTAL PROJECT COST
Compensable Total
General Contractor Base Bid Delay Days|Compensable | Base Bid & Compensable Delay
Action Roofing $277,200.00 $277,200.00
534 E. Ortega Street $0.00 5 $0.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93103
T: 805/966-3696  FAX: 805/966-6102
Subcontractors
E.F.I.S.: Specialty Team Plastering Inc.
Demolition: Honeycutt Tear Off
Crane Services: Specialty Crane & Riggin Corp., DBA Specialty Crane & Rigging
All Weather Roofing No Bid Submitted
229 N. Loma Place 5
Upland, CA 91786
T: 909/981-6498 FAX: 909/981-7363
B&M Tear Off No Bid Submitted
2420 Sana Creek Rd. 5
Brentwood, CA 94513
T: 925/755-9505 FAX: 925/755-9572
Best Contracting Services Inc. $324,400.00 $324,400.00
19027 S. Hamilton Ave $0.00 5 $0.00
Gardena, CA 90248
T: 310/328-6969 FAX: 310/328-9176
Subcontractors
Demo: B & M Tear Off

PM: J. Van Thyne
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Cambron Roofing

No Bid Submitted

P.O. Box 743

Goleta, CA 93116

T: 805/685-9496 FAX: 805/685-7791

Channel Island Roofing

$233,300.00

$233,300.00

4155 N. Southbank

$0.00

$0.00

Oxnard, CA 93036

T: 805/485-1622 FAX: 805/485-8634

Subcontractors

None

Craig Roof

$330,330.00

$330,330.00

132 Garden Street, T-1

$0.00

$0.00

Santa Barbara, CA 93101

T: 805/966-5331 FAX: 805/962-1168

Subcontractors

Removal: Roof Removal Inc.

EIFS Repair: Specialty Team Plastering Inc.

Derrick's Roofing

No Bid Submitted

650 Ward Drive, Suite F

Santa Barbara, CA 93111

T: 805/681-9954 FAX: 805/681-9952

PM: J. Van Thyne



HSSB Tower Arcade PVC Roof Replacement, HSB Building 515

FM110029S/980835

Estimated Construction Cost: $254,900.00
Bid Opening Date: Friday, September 10, 2010 @ 2:30PM

BASE BID

COMPENSABLE DELAY

TOTAL PROJECT COST

General Contractor

Base Bid

Delay

Compensable Total

Days|Compensable

Base Bid & Compensable Delay

Garcia Roofing Inc.

No Bid Submitted

201 Mount Vernon Ave

Bakersfield, CA 93307

T:661/325-5736 FAX: 661/325-1776

IB Roof Systems

No Bid Submitted

2679 Twin Creeks Drive

San Ramon, CA 94583

T: 805/701-9188 FAX: 925/830-1504

Pacific Single Ply

No Bid Submitted

P.O. Box 217

La Habra, CA 90633-0217

T:562/691-3999 FAX: 562/691-5852

Progressive Roofing

No Bid Submitted

7922 Ostrow Street

San Diego, CA 92111

T: 877/360-0030 FAX: 585/292-7805

PM: J. Van Thyne
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Sika Sarnafil

No Bid Submitted

10701 Holder Street

Cypress, CA 90630

T: 714/248-1938 FAX: 714/821-9356

Vanguard

No Bid Submitted

P.O. Box 239

Arroyo Grande, CA 93421

T: 805/503-0656 FAX: 805/676-1599

Webco

No Bid Submitted

2451 Eastman Ave.

Oxnard, CA 93030

T: 805/988-0300 FAX: 805/988-0600

Wicks Roofing Inc.

$284,435.00

$299,435.00

4554 Broad Street, Suite 200

$3,000.00

$15,000.00

San Luis Obispo, CA 93401

T: 805/546-9056 FAX: 805/546-9634

Subcontractors

PM: J. Van Thyne
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