Bid Summary

Santa Catalina Residence Hall Pool Renovation Project

FM100223L/293-36

Estimated Construction Cost: $1,050,000.00
Bid Opening Date: Tuesday, September 14, 2010 @ 2:30PM

PM: G. Levinthal

BASE BID

COMPENSABLE DELAY

ALTERNATES

TOTAL PROJECT COST

General Contractor

Base Bid

Compensable Delay  Days

Total
Compensable

Alternate #1

Base Bid & Compensable
Delays

Total with Alternate

California Commericial Pools

$634,995.00

ADD

$642,995.00

$656,995.00

2255 E. Auto Centre Drive

$800.00 10

$8,000.00

$14,000.00

Glendora, CA 91740

T:909/394-1280  FAX: 909/394-1630

Subcontractors

Electrical: Trilek Electric Plaster: Cruz Pool Plastering Inc.

Demolition: Independent Concrete Cutting Inc. \

Solar: Mohr Power Solar Inc., DBA 21st Century Sol

ar

Condor Inc.

No Bid Submitted

3000 Durfee Ave.

10

El Monte, CA 91732

T: 626/455-0050 FAX: 626/455-0070

Diani Building Corp.

$617,000.00

ADD

$622,000.00

$630,890.00

351 Blosser Rd.

$500.00 10

$5,000.00

$8,890.00

Santa Maria, CA 93455

T: 805/925-9533 FAX: 805/928-2150

Subcontractors

Swimming Pool: Condor Inc. Solar Heating: Suntrek Industries

Plumbing: Koehler Plumbing Inc. \

Demo/ Grading: Schwan Brothers Excavating Contr

actors Inc.

Imperial Electric

No Bid Submitted

6445 Calle Real

10

Goleta, CA 93117

T: 805/681-0676 FAX: 805/681-0703

IWL

No Bid Submitted

415 N. Quarantina Street

10

Santa Barbara, CA 93101

T: 805/956-2907 FAX: 805/957-1947

Subcontractors
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Melchiori Construction

No Bid Submitted

809 De La Vina Street

10

Santa Barbara, CA 93105

T: 805/962-9505 FAX: 805/962-8776

Nadar Inc.

$624,900.00

ADD

$629,900.00 $638,600.00

2596 N. Fairoaks

$500.00 10 $5,000.00

$8,700.00

Altadena, CA 91001

T:626/791-9751  FAX: 626/398-0471

Subcontractors

Pool Plaster: Cruz Pool Plastering Inc.

Electrical:

Russ Electric Shotcrete: Superio

r Gunite

Caulking: Pacific Waterproofing & Restoration Inc.

Concrete Cutting: Big K Industries Inc.

Reinforcing Steel: Vista Steel Company Solar: Building Industries Solar Inc., DBA California Solar Concrete Dem

0: West Coast & Sons

Newton Construction & Management Inc.

$704,000.00

ADD

$706,000.00 $726,000.00

P.O. Box 3280

$200.00 10 $2,000.00

$20,000.00

San Luis Obispo, CA 93403

T: 805/544-5583 FAX: 805/681-0703

Subcontractors

Pool: Barefoot Enterprises Inc.

SBS Corp.

$1,027,652.00

ADD

$1,027,652.00 $1,036,967.00

31416 Agoura Road, Suite 135

$0.00 10 $0.00

$9,315.00

Westlake Village, CA 91361

T:818/597-4363  FAX: 818/597-4368

Subcontractors

Pool: Mission Pools of Escondido

Seguro Corporation

No Bid Submitted

820 State Stree, 4th Floor

10

Santa Barbara, CA 93101

T: 805/564-7800 FAX: 805/584-7809
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Specialty Construction

No Bid Submitted

645 Clarion

10

San Luis Obispo, CA 93405

T: 805/543-1706  FAX:

Spiess Construction

No Bid Submitted

1110 E. Clark Ave. Suite 210

10

Santa Maria, CA 93455

T: 805/937-5859  FAX: 805/934-4432

Tricon Aquatics

$671,337.00

ADD

$676,337.00

$691,297.00

11419 Sunrise Gold Circle #6

$500.00 10

$5,000.00

$14,960.00

Rancho Cordova, CA 95742

T:916/638-9866 FAX: 916/638-9867

Subcontractors

Tile & Plaster: Burkett's Pool Tile & Masonrty Inc.

R. Steel: CMC Steel Fabricatiors

Inc., DBA C M C Rebar

Demo: Schwan Brothers Excavating Contractors inc.

Solar: Suntrek Industries Inc.

Gunite: Superior Gunite Concrete: Trademark Co

ncrete Systems Inc.

Village Pool Builders

No Bid Submitted

9 South Quarantina

10

Santa Barbara, CA 93103

T: 805/969-0211 FAX: 805/969-1107
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