
West Campus Bluff Path Re-bid
Project No.: FM080001SR/987696/076-96

Estimated Construction Cost: $200,000.00
University Representative: Ray Aronson

ALTERNATES

 General Contractor Base Bid Compensable Delay Days
Total 
Compensable Alternate #1 Alternate #2

Base Bid & 
Compensable 
Delays Total Alternates 

Total with all 
Alternates

Berry General Eng. Contractors E-15
PO Box 1457 $214,431.00 $75.00 30 $2,250.00 $37,829.00 $6,619.00 $216,681.00 $44,448.00 $261,129.00
Ventura, CA 93002
T:   805/643-7567  FAX: 805/643-7482

Subcontractors

Bob's Backhoe    I-2
6051 Stow Canyon Road $158,000.00 $3,800.00 30 $114,000.00 $17,770.00 $3,000.00 $272,000.00 $20,770.00 $292,770.00
Goleta, CA 93117
T:   805/967-5849   FAX:  805/683-1989

Subcontractors
D.G. - Challenge Asphalt

Brough Construction   A-9
634 Printz Rd. $192,245.00 $500.00 30 $15,000.00 $24,630.00 $2,190.00 $207,245.00 $26,820.00 $234,065.00
Arroyo Grande, CA 93420
T:    805/489-7779  FAX:  805/473-2479

Subcontractors

Cal Fran Engineering, Inc.  C-9
990 Enchanted Way Suite 106 $159,000.00 $30.00 30 $900.00 $19,000.00 $3,100.00 $159,900.00 $22,100.00 $182,000.00
Simi Valley, CA 93065
T:   805/579-9173   FAX: 805/579-8211

Subcontractors
Survey- Rincon Survey

BASE BID COMPENSABLE DELAY TOTAL PROJECT COST

Bid Open: 2:30PM, Tuesday, December 7, 2010
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D-Kal Engineering, Inc.  F-5
PO Box 1919 $163,568.00 $100.00 30 $3,000.00 $17,250.00 $4,375.00 $166,568.00 $21,625.00 $188,193.00
San Luis Obispo, CA 93406
T:    805/543-7758  FAX:  805/543-7759 

Subcontractors

Granite Construction  H-7
585 W. Beach St.                     5335 Debbie Lane $180,549.00 $1.00 30 $30.00 $23,500.00 $2,750.00 $180,579.00 $26,250.00 $206,829.00
Watsonville, CA 95076          SB, CA 93111
T:   831/724-1011     FAX:  831/768-4021
T:  805/964-9951     FAX:  805/967-1431

Subcontractors

Hanely General Engineering Corp. B-19
30 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

NO BID RECEIVED
T:      FAX: 

Subcontractors

IWL, Inc. -  V-8 
PO Box 4669 $187,000.00 $0.00 30 $0.00 $12,500.00 $4,000.00 $187,000.00 $16,500.00 $203,500.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93140-4669
T:  805/966-2907    FAX:  805/957-1947

Subcontractos
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Lash Construction  O-13
721 Carpinteria Street                   PO box 4640 $156,583.00 $1.00 30 $30.00 $25,264.00 $2,124.00 $156,613.00 $27,388.00 $184,001.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93103            SB, CA 93140
T:   805/963-3553   FAX:  805/965-8189

Subcontractors
Survey - Rincon Survey

PJP Restoration   K-4
30 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

NO BID RECEIVED
T:      FAX: 

Subcontractors

Quality Paving    G-4
30 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

NO BID RECEIVED
T:      FAX: 

Subcontractors
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Rockwood  B-15
781 Calle Bendita $186,800.00 $100.00 30 $3,000.00 $30,400.00 $2,200.00 $189,800.00 $32,600.00 $222,400.00
Arroyo Grande, CA 93420
T:  805/343-7738    FAX:  805/343-7736

Subcontractors

Sansone Company    R-3
30 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

NO BID RECEIVED
T:      FAX: 

Subcontractors

Schock Contracting Corp    I-7
30 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

NO BID RECEIVED
T:      FAX: 

Subcontractors

Shaw Contracting, Inc.  T-6
PO Box 171 $174,483.00 $0.00 30 $0.00 $25,000.00 $3,950.00 $174,483.00 $28,950.00 $203,433.00
Carpinteria, CA 93014
T:  805/649-2107    FAX:  805/649-9838

Subcontractors

Bid Open: 2:30PM, Tuesday, December 7, 2010


