

BASE BID		COMPENSABLE DELAY			TOTAL PROJECT COST	
General Contractor	Base Bid	Compensable Delay	Days	Total Compensable	Base Bid & Compensable Delays	Total
Anderson Systems 5958 Corta St. Goleta, CA 93117 T: 805-683-6133 FAX: 805-964-2357	NO BID RECEIVED		5	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Subcontractors						
Ardalan Construction Company 1459 Thousand Oaks Blvd. Suite G1 Thousand Oaks, CA 91362 T: 805-496-7273 FAX: 805-496-7310	\$243,000.00	\$100.00	5	\$500.00	\$243,500.00	\$243,500.00
Subcontractors	Plumbing - Dahl					
Acoustics Ceiling - Prime Acoustics	Framing - Senel Construction					
Electrical - Vastola Electric	Flooring - Pyramid Flooring					
HVAC - Dahl	Fire Sprinkler - California Central Fire Protection					
Brannon DBA Smith Electric Service 1340 W. Betteravia Road Santa Maria, CA 93455 T: 805/621-5000 FAX: 805/621-5050	\$223,900.00	\$0.00	5	\$0.00	\$223,900.00	\$223,900.00
Subcontractors	Controls - Johnson Controls					
Acoustical Ceiling - Pacific Acoustics	Fire Sprinklers - CA Central Fire					
Painting - Guy Smithson	Flooring - Curtis Carpet					
Comm/Data - Pacificom						
Channel Coast Corp 123 Santa Barbara St. Santa Barbara, CA 93101 T: 805-899-1227 FAX: 805-899-8690	NO BID RECEIVED		5	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Subcontractors						

BASE BID		COMPENSABLE DELAY			TOTAL PROJECT COST	
General Contractor	Base Bid	Compensable Delay	Days	Total Compensable	Base Bid & Compensable Delays	Total
EJS Construction 4191 Carpinteria Avenue, Ste 7 Carpinteria, CA 93013 T: 805/684-6381 FAX: 805/684-6446	\$221,000.00	\$0.00	5	\$0.00	\$221,000.00	\$221,000.00
Subcontractors	Flooring - Curtis Carpet Inc.	Fire Sprinkler - California Central Fire Protection, Inc.				
Drywall - Garibay Drywall	Plumbing - Alpha Plumbing	Electrical - Vastola Electric				
Paint - Versicolor	HVAC - Alpha Plumbing	Data - Vastola Electric				
Ceiling - Pacific Acoustics North	Controls - Johnson Controls	Fire Alarm - Vastola Electric				
Newton Construction 259 Higuera Street PO BOX 32 San Luis Obispo, CA 93401 SLO, CA 93403 T: 805/544-5583 FAX: 805/544-5584	\$217,980.00	\$100.00	5	\$500.00	\$218,480.00	\$218,480.00
Subcontractors	Acoustical Ceiling - Pacific Acoustics	HVAC Controls - Johnson Controls				
Painting - Channel Coast	Fire Protection - R&R	Electrical - Pac-West General				
Flooring - Curtis Carpet	HVAC - Alpha Plumbing & Mechanical					
Drywall & Metal Framing - Premier Drywall	Plumbing - Koehler					
Quincon Inc. 1140 Encinita Ct. Grover Beach, CA 93433 T: 805/305-1150 FAX: 805/481-2440	NO BID RECEIVED		5	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Subcontractors						
Sanders Construction 20331 Lake Forest #C2 Lake Forest, CA 92630 T: 949-951-6944 FAX: 949-951-6938	NO BID RECEIVED		5	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Subcontractors						

BASE BID		COMPENSABLE DELAY			TOTAL PROJECT COST	
General Contractor	Base Bid	Compensable Delay	Days	Total Compensable	Base Bid & Compensable Delays	Total
SBS Corporation						
31416 Agoura Rd Suite 135	\$241,460.00	\$0.00	5	\$0.00	\$241,460.00	\$241,460.00
Westlake Village, CA 91361						
T: 818-597-4363 FAX: 818-597-4368						
Subcontractors	Drywall - Versacolor					
Fire Sprinklers - Superior Fire Inc.	Mechanical - CPPI Mechanical					
Firestopping - Karcher Interior Systems Inc.	Electrical - Vastola Electric					
Acoustical Ceilings - Pacific Acoustics North	Plumbing - MM Mechanical					
Vernon Construction						
581 Las Alturas			5	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93101	NO BID RECEIVED					
T: 805-746-5176 FAX: 805-715-3424						
Subcontractors						