
Room 1410 Visitor Center Improvements
Project No.:  FM110119S/987763
University Representative: 

Estimated Construction Cost: $105,000.00
University Representative: Jennifer Hernandez

TAL PROJECT COST

 General Contractor Base Bid
Compensable 
Delay Days

Total 
Compensable

Base Bid & 
Compensable 
Delays Total

Bottenfield Construction
24832 Apple St. 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Newhall, CA 93001 NO BID RECEIVED
T: 661-260-1720     FAX:  661-260-1401

Subcontractors

Brannon Inc. DBA Smith Electric Services
1340 Betteravia Road $113,822.00 $0.00 5 $0.00 $113,822.00 $113,822.00
Santa Maria, CA 93455
T:   805-621-5000   FAX:  805-621-5050

Subcontractors Signage - Signs of Success
Casework- Salem Cabinet Acoustic Ceiling - Pacific Acoustics
Flooring - Floor Connection Fire Sprinklers - Cal Central Fire
Painting- Guy Smithson

Channel Coast Corporation
123 Santa Barbara St. 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93101 NO BID RECEIVED
T:    805-899-1227  FAX:  805-899-8690

Subcontractors

EJS Construction Inc.
4998 Foothill Road $89,000.00 $0.00 5 $0.00 $89,000.00 $89,000.00
Carpinteria, CA 93013
T:   805-684-6312   FAX:  805-684-6446

Subcontractors Paint - Marvista Fire Protection - 3-D Fire
Electrical - R/A Electric Flooring - Curtis Carpet
Drywall - Pacific Int. Ceiling - Pacific Acoustics
HVAC - Top Notch Heating Millwork - Salem Cabinets Inc.

BASE BID COMPENSABLE DELAY

Bid Open: 2:30PM, Friday, January 7, 2011
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Halsell Builders
3130 Skyway Dr. Suite 601 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Santa Maria, CA 93455 NO BID RECEIVED
T:    805-928-8948  FAX:  805-928-1129

Subcontractors

KGM Construction
PO Box 1315 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Templeton, CA  93405 NO BID RECEIVED
T:   805-459-2529   FAX:  805-434-2008

Subcontractors

Newton Construction & Management Inc
P.O. Box 3260 $112,499.00 $100.00 5 $500.00 $112,999.00 $112,999.00
San Luis Obispo, CA 93403
T:   805-544-5583   FAX:  805-544-5584

Subcontractors Acoustical Ceiling - Pacific Acoustics
Casework - Salem Co. Fire Protection - 3-D Fire
Painting - Marvista Electrical - Pac West General
Flooring - Floor Connection

Premier West
740 West Grove Ave. $202,498.76 $1,385.00 5 $6,925.00 $209,423.76 $209,423.76
Orange, CA 92865
T:  714-279-0903    FAX:  714-279-0856

Subcontractors
Drywall, Framing, Painting, Carpet, Demo, Finish Carpentry - Logan Construction
Electrical - R&M Electric
Carpentry - Glenn Hager Cabinets

Bid Open: 2:30PM, Friday, January 7, 2011
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Quincon, Inc.
PO Box 1029 $125,200.00 $100.00 5 $500.00 $125,700.00 $125,700.00
Grover Beach, CA  93483
T:  805-305-1150     FAX:  805-481-2440

Subcontractors Translucent Window Film - Signs for Success Carpet/Base - Floor Connection 
Aluminum Lettering - Signs of Success Metal Supports System/Gypsum Wallboard - Hernandez Drywall Painting - Channel Coast Corp
Cabinets/Countertops - Salem Cabinetry Composit Concrete Panels - Salem Fire Protection - CPPI Mechanical
Insulation - American Eco-Services Acoustic Ceiling - Pacific Acoustics Electrical/Comm.. - Oil Field Electric

Sanders Construction Services
5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Lake Forest, CA NO BID RECEIVED
T:  949-951-6944    FAX:  49-951-6938

Subcontractors

Seguro Corporation
820 State St. 4th Floor $157,222.00 $0.00 5 $0.00 $157,222.00 $157,222.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93101
T:  805-564-7800    FAX:  805-564-7809

Subcontractors Paint - Channel Coast
Carpentry - J-Tap Construction Flooring - Curtis
Cabinetry - Salem Cabinets
Electric - RA Electric

Vernon & Associates Construction, Inc.
581 Las Alturas $101,900.00 $0.00 5 $0.00 $101,900.00 $101,900.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93103
T:  805-305-0105    FAX:  805-233-6644

Subcontractors Concrete Panels - Art Flooring Paint - Channel Coast Corp.
Electrical - Oilfield Electric Cabinets - Cabinet Connection Acoustics - Pacific Acoustics
Flooring - Miguel's Custom Carpet Finish Cabinetry - Kimmell Hanson
Drywall/Partition - Pacific Interior Fire - Nargan

Bid Open: 2:30PM, Friday, January 7, 2011


