
Room 1508 Renovation De La Guerra Bldg. 549
Project No.:  FM100222S/987756

Estimated Construction Cost:$147,539.00
University Representative: Jennifer Hernandez

TAL PROJECT COST

 General Contractor Base Bid
Compensable 
Delay Days

Total 
Compensable

Base Bid & 
Compensable 
Delays Total

B H Kruper Renovation
7008 Reseda Blvd. 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Reseda, CA 91335 NO BID SUBMITTED
T:  818-343-0016    FAX:  818-343-0065

Subcontractors

Brannon Inc. DBA Smith Electric Service
1340 W. Betteravia Road $142,000.00 $0.00 5 $0.00 $142,000.00 $142,000.00
Santa Maria, CA 93455
T:   805/621-5000   FAX:  805/621-5050

Subcontractors Acoustical Ceiling- Pacific Acoustic
Demo- Channel Coast Corp. Air Balance- Superior Test & Balance
Aluminum & Glass- Santa Barbara Glass Fire Alarm- Integrated Fire & Safety
Flooring- Floor Connection
Painting- Guy Smithson

Channel Coast Corporation
123 Santa Barbara St. $182,194.00 $0.00 5 $0.00 $182,194.00 $182,194.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93101
T:  805-899-1227    FAX: 805-899-8690

Subcontractors HVAC- J.R. Barto
Electrical- R.A. Electric Acoustic Ceiling- Prime
Flooring- The Floor Connection Framing & Drywall- R.T. Drywall
Fire Alarm/Data- R. A Electric
Window- Santa Barbara Glass Co.

EJS Construction
4998 Foothill Road 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Carpinteria, CA NO BID SUBMITTED
T:   805/684-6381   FAX:  805/684-6446

Subcontractors

BASE BID COMPENSABLE DELAY

Bid Open: 2:30 PM, February 15, 2011.
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Newton Construction  
259 Higuera Street                                         PO Box $154,800.00 $100.00 5 $500.00 $155,300.00 $155,300.00
San Luis Obispo, CA 93401                     SLO, CA 93403
T:   805/544-5583   FAX:  805/544-5584

Subcontractors Electrical- PacWest General
Storefront- Santa Barbara Glass Co. HVAC- Alpha Plumbing
Acoustical Tile- Santa Maria Acoustical
Painting- Guy Smithson
Flooring- Floor Connection

Quincon Inc. 
1140 Encinita Ct. 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Grover Beach, CA 93433 NO BID SUBMITTED
T:   805/305-1150   FAX:  805/481-2440

Subcontractors

S.J. Amoroso Construction Co., Inc.
275 E. Baker St. Suite B 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Costa Mesa, CA 92626 NO BID SUBMITTED
T: 714-433-2326     FAX:  714-433-2329

Subcontractors

Vernon & Associates Construction, Inc.
581 Las Alturas $157,100.00 $0.00 5 $0.00 $157,100.00 $157,100.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93103
T:  805/284-9428    FAX:  805/233-6644

Subcontractors Electrical- R.A. Electric
Windows- SB Glass
T-bar/Drywall Metal Framing- Master Drywall
Mechanical- Dahl
Flooring- Floor Connection

Bid Open: 2:30 PM, February 15, 2011.


